
From: bellaklein
To: Lesley Groff <lesleyjee®gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Frederick Fekkai appointments Nov,18th 
Date: Thu, 19 Nov 2015 17:56:23 +0000 

Great, 
Thank you Les, 
Bella 

Tel: 

> On Nov 19, 2015, at 12:47 PM, Lesley Groff <lesley.jee@gmail.com> wrote: 

> Jeffrey had his hair cut last night with Patrick $235.13 total 

> • He took, I think, Nastaya with him and she had a single process color $209 total 

> • Fekkai is having problems with emailing receipts...they hope to be able to send receipt 
next week. 

EFTA00334690


