From: Richard Kahn <||| | R
To: Lesley Groff <[

Subject: Re: Confirmation of your request

Date: Tue, 17 Nov 2015 19:42:27 +0000

please advise 1f we shall make check payable to you or Amex
thanks

Richard Kahn
HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cell

On Nov 17, 2015, at 2:28 PM, Lesley Gruff‘&-* wrote:

1500 CAD to Fairmont Waterfront for Conf. Feb. 15-19.2016

Begin forwarded message:

From: The Fairmont Waterfront <} NG -

Subject: Confirmation of your request
Date: November 17, 2015 at 2:26:57 PM EST
To: < -

Hello Lesley Groff,

Thank you for your payment information.
Hotel : The Fairmont Waterfront
Event Name: Enhanced Education

Event Date: 15-Mar-2016
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Sales/Service Manager: Jean-Roger Girard

Block Code: ENHA1115

Regards,

The Fairmont Waterfront
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