From: [
To: Bebe Avdiu <[ T -

Subject: Re: Doors for mechanical building -

Date: Thu, 15 Oct 2015 14:49:09 +0000

you're the best!

On Oct 15, 2015, at 10:37 AM, Bebe Avdiu <] G - ot

Yep! [ onit=

Bebe Avdiu
Legal Assistant
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor

Mew York, New b 10022
Telephone: B
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The information contained in this communication 15 confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, and 15 intended only for the use of the
addressee.

It is the property of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly
prohibited

and may be unlawftul. If vou have received this communication i error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this
communication

and all copies thereof, including all attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2015 Darren K. Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved.
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On Oct 15, 2015, at 10:35 AM, | NG o

stay on him!.._so he stay's on his supply company! ;)

On Oct 15, 2015, at 10:33 AM, Bebe Avdiu <G - ot

Followed up with Peter this morning, he said he didn’t receive an email as of yet for re pricing of the
invoice from the supply company. He should hear back hopefully by today, if not, then by early next week.

Bebe Avdiu

Legal Assistant

DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC
:lﬁ:l |.L3\1‘I-I;_E|.|.:l:'l. ."\.'. C1ue, -1'.]! ]:Il:llﬂ'

MNew York, Mew York 10022

Telephone: [N
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The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, and is intended only for the use of the
addressee.

It 15 the property of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly
prohibited

and may be unlawful. If vou have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this
communication

and all copies thereof, including all attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2015 Darren K. Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved.
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On Oct 13, 2015, at 11:56 AM, Bebe Avdiu <] G - ot

Also, they would not deliver to LSJ. They do deliver to Florida, or to a port in Florida, but that’s as far as
they go he said.

Bebe Avdiu

Legal Assistant

DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC
:JF":J |.LNI‘I'I;_’J.U['I. .'ll't.‘u'l.'I-ILJl.'.| 4{]3 ]:ll.:ll.ﬂ'

Mew York, New Yorl 10022

Telephone:
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On Oct 13, 2015, at 11:54 AM, Bebe Avdiu <] G - ot

Spoke to Peter today (Greg Sanders no longer works there) from Taylor, Cotton, Ridley, Inc. I sent him
the 2013 estimate that we received from Greg Sanders, which [ have also attached for your reference, he
said that he will take a look at the invoice to make sure there are no price changes on these items,
specifically, as prices have gone up. He said it will take 2-3 days for him to get back to me but [ will
definitely follow up on this by Friday. He will email me pictures as well.

Peter Davila

Email: |

<Little St James SL17 replacement Revision 1.pdf=
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Bebe Avdiu

Legal Assistant

DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC
:\ln:l |.Lh:i|-|g|.|.:l:1 .1\.'. enue, -1'.]! ]:ll:llﬂ'
Mew York, New York 10022

Telephone: -_'_1]1] 971-1308
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The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attormey-client privileged, and 15 intended only for the use of the
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On Oct 9, 2015, at 6:08 PM, [ GG -

Hi Bebe....on Monday, can you please call this company, Taylor, Cotton & Ridley, and reference this
attached quote...Ask for Greg Sanders (Daphne believes he should still work there) This quote 1s from
2013, Jeffrey wants to revisit the possibility of getting these doors for the mechanical building.
Daphne/Rich would like to see pictures of the doors...Can you ask Greg (or someone there) to please
forward you pictures of the doors they are quoting? Add this to your To Do list :)

Begin forwarded message:

From: Daphne Wallace </ NN -
Subject: Fwd: Little St James SL17 replacement Revision 1
Date: October 9, 2015 at 4:05:59 PM EDT

To: [ -

As promised, DW

—————————— Forwarded message ----------

From: Daphne Wallace <

Date: Mon, Oct 5, 2015 at 8:43 AM

Subject: Fwd: Little St James SL17 replacement Revision 1

To: Rich Kahn < =, ann rodriquez f—}

Quote to replace RO and Engineering doors - 2013, DW
—————————— Forwarded message ------—-—-
From: Daphne Wallace {_}
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Date: Tue, Aug 27, 2013 at 11:32 AM

Subject: Fwd: Little St James SL17 replacement Revision 1
To: Roy Hodges ‘ Rich Kahn < |

Greetings Gentlemen,

After waiting weeks for the revised quote for the hardware, and threatening today to go to someone
else, Greg graciously sent the revised quote - hardware was 524K, now $19K.

I would like to table this project until next week, and at that time discuss PLAN B - purchase the
fiberglass doors from the company (525K, and purchase and install more practical (economical)
hardware once the doors are on site. DW

---—-mm--- Forwarded message ----------
From: Greg Sanders <
Date: Tue, Aug 27, 2013 at 11:26 AM

Subject: Little St James SL17 replacement Revision 1
To: Daphne Wallace ﬂ*

Daphne, requite with standard vertical rods and heavy duty LCN closers.

Greg Sanders, AHC Project Manager

Office: 407.298.5114 (ext 214) / Cell: ||| Gz
|

Taylor, Cotton, & Ridley Inc. - ORLANDO

1904 Brengle Avenue Orlando, F1 32808

This email message is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential and
privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you
are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the
original message.
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