
From: Bebe Avdiu  
To: 
Cc: Daphne Wallace , Anna Rodriquez

Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Revised quote 

Date: Thu, 15 Oct 2015 20:45:48 +0000 

>) 

Just sent him an email about pictures. 

Bebe Avdiu 
Legal Assistant 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, 
Telephone: 

******************************************************************************** 

***** 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. 
It is the property of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication 
and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - 2015 Darren K. Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved. 
******************************************************************************** 
***** 

On Oct 15, 2015, at 4:43 PM, > wrote: 

You need to ask him to send pictures of this product he is quoting on. I believe that was the idea from the start. 
That Jeffrey and rich want to see pics of the doors they are quoting. Besides that, daphne will need to let you k 
ow how to proceed. She is back on 19th 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 15, 2015, at 4:32 PM, Bebe Avdiu < > wrote: 

See below and let me know how I should proceed or if Daphne or Anna will deal with the payment stuff. 

Thanks! 

Bebe Avdiu 
Legal Assistant 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, New York 10022 
Telephone: 

EFTA00337499
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Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Pete Davila" 
Subject: Revised quote 
Date: October 15, 2015 at 4:26:47 PM EDT 
To: "'Bebe Avdiu'" <I

Hello Bebe, 
I received the updated Special-lite pricing and it's just slightly higher. 
The hardware will also be a little higher. 
Can you please send me your company info so I can included in the revised quote. 
We also need to discuss Payment terms. 
Thank you 
Pete Davila 
Taylor, Cotton & Ridley, Inc. 

From: Bebe Avdiu [mailto 
Sent: Tuesday, October 13, 2015 11:41 AM 
To: 
Subject: 

EFTA00337500


