
From: ==la 
To: Natalia X Molotkova 

Subject: Re: Reservation request 
Date: Thu, 17 Sep 2015 21:55:11 +0000 

I"m geting nervous...why no letter yet? or real confirm of reservation? 

On Sep 17, 2015, at 3:03 PM, Natalia X Molotkova <  wrote: 

> Thank you so much!! 

> • Natalia (Natasha) Molotkoval Relationship Manager 
> American Express Centurion Servicing 
> Working hours: 10:30am-7:00pm Monday-Friday 
> ❑ 770-242-9187 ext 63152 

> • Behind every great travel moment is a Journeymaker 
> who helped make it happen. 

• Original Message 
> From: (mailto• 
> Sent: Thursday, September 17, 2015 3:07 PM 
> To: Natalia X Molotkova 
> Subject: Re: Reservation request 

> • Dear Natalia, 

> • Thank you very much for your email. 
> The room is well blocked in our system. 
> I will send you the credit card authorization and visa forms shortly. 

> Sunny regards, 
> Amandine GOUINEAU 
> Hotel Villa Lodge 4 epices 

> • Le 2015-09-17 14:06, Natalia X Molotkova a ecrit : 
>> Dear Amandine, 
>> 
>> Will you please reserve the room for , arriving October 
>> 15th, check out November 15th. Please email the credit card 
>> authorization form for the deposit or I can call you back with the 
» credit card number. 
>> 
>> is a citizen of Belarus, she needs visa to go to St. Barth. Can 
>> you please send us the letter of invitation? Her date of birth is 31 
>> May 1989, passport number is PP0232844, expires 15 June 2025. 
>> 
>> Thank you so much, 
>> 
>> NATALIA (NATASHA) MOLOTKOVAI Relationship Manager 
>> 
>> American Express Centurion Servicing 
>> 
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>> Working hours: 10:30am-7:00pm Monday-Friday 
> > 
• ' 770-242-9187 ext 63152 * 
> > 
>> _Behind every great travel moment is a Journeymaker 
> > 
>> _who helped make it happen. [1] _ 

>> American Express made the following annotations 

>> • "This message and any attachments are solely for the intended 
>> recipient and may contain confidential or privileged information. If 
>> you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, use, or 
>> distribution of the information included in this message and any 
>> attachments is prohibited. If you have received this communication in 
>> error, please notify us by reply e-mail and immediately and 
>> permanently delete this message and any attachments. Thank you." 

>> American Express a ajoute le commentaire suivant le Ce courrier et 
>> toute piece jointe qu'il contient sont reserves au seul destinataire 
>> indique et peuvent renfermer des renseignements confidentiels et 
» privilegies. Si vous pas le destinataire prevu, toute 
>> divulgation, duplication, utilisation ou distribution du courrier ou 
>> de toute piece jointe est interdite. Si vous avez recu cette 
>> communication par erreur, veuillez nous en aviser par courrier et 
» detruire immediatement le courrier et les pieces jointes. Merci. 

» Links: 

» [1] 

> • American Express made the following annotations 
• ww**www************www**www**www***ww**www**www**www**www**www**www**www***ww* 

> "This message and any attachments are solely for the intended recipient and may contain 
confidential or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, any 
disclosure, copying, use, or distribution of the information included in this message and any 
attachments is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify us 
by reply e-mail and immediately and permanently delete this message and any attachments. 
Thank you." 

> American Express a ajoute le commentaire suivant le Ce courrier et toute piece jointe qu'il 
contient sont reserves au seul destinataire indique et peuvent renfermer des 
> renseignements confidentiels et privilegies. Si vous pas le destinataire prevu, 
toute divulgation, duplication, utilisation ou distribution du courrier ou de toute piece 
jointe est interdite. Si vous avez recu cette communication par erreur, veuillez nous en 
aviser par courrier et detruire immediatement le courrier et les pieces jointes. Merci. 

*********WWW********************************WWW**WWW************************** 
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