
From:
To: Bella Klein 

Subject: Re: Need copy of Front & Back of JE's Amex 
Date: Fri, 18 Sep 2015 20:22:03 +0000 

thanks! 

On Sep 18, 2015, at 4:21 PM, bellaklein > wrote: 

> <Amex Black_ JEP_ 3001 _JE walet_120114.pdf> 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 

> • Tel: 

>> On Sep 18, 2015, at 4:18 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: 
>> 
>> Hi Bella...I need a copy of JE's current Amex card front and back_I only have the front...do 
you have both sides? Can you send to me asap? 
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