
From: Lesley Groff <a 
To: Debbie Fife 

Subject: Re: Robin Hood per 
Date: Mon, 20 Apr 2015 17:53:27 +0000 

Fantastic! thank you 

On Apr 20, 2015, at 1:47 PM, Debbie Fife wrote: 

> Hi Lesley -
> Eva did mention this and we will do our BEST... 
> Just to be clear - it's hard to put a $30K table ahead of the $50K, $100K and $250K - but 
we will do our very best - (and most especially for EVA! ) 

> Debbie Fife 
> Event Associates, Inc. 

• Original Message 
> From: Lesley Groff (mailto: 
> Sent: Monday, April 20, 2015 1:42 PM 
> To: Debbie Fife 
> Subject: Re: Robin Hood per Eva Dubin 

> • Hi Debbie...Jeffrey wants to make sure the girls get a really great table at the 
event  1''' OK? :) 

> On Apr 13, 2015, at 8:29 AM, Debbie Fife < wrote: 

>> Thanks, Lesley! 
>> xx 
>> 
>> Debbie Fife 
» Event Associates Inc. 
>> 
>> 
>> 
>> 
>>  Original Message 
>> From: Lesley Groff (mailto: 
>> Sent: Monday, April 13, 2015 6:38 AM 
>> To: Debbie Fife 
>> Subject: Re: Robin Hood per Eva Dubin 
>> 
>> HI Debbie...Jeffrey would like to be listed with his name! : Jeffrey 
» Epstein and sounds good re guests early May...thanks 
>> 
>> On Apr 10, 2015, at 4:45 PM, Debbie Fife < > wrote: 
>> 
>>> Hi Leslie - quick Q --
>» How should we "list" -- "anonymous" or ? 
>>> Sorry if I'm repeating this -
>>> Payment received and we'll be back to you in early May with guest arrival instructions 
and to get your 10 names! 
>>> Happy weekend, 
>» Debbie 
>>> x 
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>>> 
>>> Debbie Fife 
>>> Event Associates, Inc. 
>>> 
>>> 
>>> 
>>> 
>>>  Original Message 
>>> From: Lesley Groff [mailto: 
>>> Sent: Saturday, March 28, 2015 9:37 AM 
>>> To: Debbie Fife 
>>> Subject: Re: Robin Hood per Eva Dubin 
>>> 
>>> you too! 
>>> On Mar 28, 2015, at 9:37 AM, Debbie Fife > wrote: 
>>> 
>>>> Thanks Lesley. 
>>>> Have a great weekend. 
>>>> D 
>>>> 
>>>> Debbie Fife 

>>>> On Mar 28, 2015, at 9:22 AM, Lesley Groff 
mailto: > wrote: 

>>>> 
>>>> rich, I will take care of guest names and asking JE how he would like to be listed in 
the program...thanks! 
>>>> 
>>>> On Mar 27, 2015, at 2:26 PM, Debbie Fife 

> wrote: 
>>>> 
>>>> Hi Richard - thanks and that's wonderful -
»» 
>>>> Yes, we can reserve a $30K table for you -
»» 
>>>> Please see the REPLY FORM attached - and that has all details... 
>>>> 
>>>> Could you please confirm how you want to be listed - or anonymous? 
>>>> 
>>>> Checks should be payable to ROBIN HOOD and mailed to: 
>>>> 
>>>> Robin Hood Benefit 
>>» 826 Broadway 
>>>> 9th Floor 
>>>> New York, NY 10003 
>>>> 
>>>> Wire info is attached - please let us know if you prefer to pay by wire so we can let 
you know when it is received! 
>>>> 
>>>> Thanks, again - and looking forward.... We're "paperless" so the 
>>>> attachment "Robin Hood Benefit" is all the info for your guests -
»» 
>>>> We will need the 10 names in early May and all guests will check in at the door. 
>>>> 
>>>> Thanks again and please confirm payment method -
»» 
>>>> Best, 
>>>> Debbie 
>>>> 
>>>> Debbie Fife 
>>>> Event Associates, Inc. 
>>>> 
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>>>> 
>>>> From: Richard Kahn [mailto: 
>>>> Sent: Friday, March 27, 2015 1:20 PM 
>>» To: Debbie Fife 
>>>> Cc: Lesley Groff 
>>>> Subject: Fwd: Robin Hood per Eva Dubin 
>>>> 
>>>> i work with Lesley and would like to purchase a $30,000 table please 
>>>> advise if still available and whom check should be made payable to, 
>>>> sent to, etc we can also send a wire if easier thank you 
>>>> 
>>>> 
>>>> 
>>>> 
>>>> 
>> 
>> 
>> 
>>>> 
>>>> 
>>>> 
>>>> 
>>>> Begin forwarded message: 
>>>> 
>>>> 
>>>> From: Debbie Fife 
>>>> < <mailto:debbief@eventassociatesinc.co 
>>>> m 
>>>>> 
>>>>> 
>>>> Subject: Robin Hood per Eva Dubin 
>>>> Date: March 23, 2015 at 3:50:00 PM EDT 

mailto:>>>> 
<mailto: >>>> To: " 

>>>> 
>>» Hi Lesley -
»» Here's all the info -
»» Thank you, and please let me know what to reserve.... 
>>» Best, 
>>» Debbie 
>>>> 
>>>> Debbie Fife 
>>>> Event Associates, Inc. 
>>» 162 West 56th Street, Suite 405 
>>>> New York, NY 10019 
>>>> 
>>>> 
>>>> <mailto: 
>>>>> 
>>>> 
>>>> <Robin Hood 2015 Reply 
>>>> Form.pdf><Robin_Hood_Benefit_2015.pdf><2015_WIRE_TRANSFER_INFORMATIO 
>>>> N 
>>>> 
>>>> Form.pdf> 
>>>> 
>>> 
>> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
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