
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

To: Lesley Groff 

Subject: Re: flight 

Date: Sun, 15 Feb 2015 15:41:40 +0000 

ok 

On Sun, Feb 15, 2015 at 10:15 AM Lesley Groff < wrote: 
I reserved this same flight for on Emirates last night but still have not rec'd the email...I called again 
this morning and still await. 

Depart March 1 Emirates #205 Biz Class at 3:40pm from Milan arrive JFK 7:00pm 
Depart March 11 Emirates #206 Biz Class at 10:20pm from JFK arrive Milan 12:05pm March 12 
First Row not available. Holding 3rd row (which is first available row, window (8K) both ways 

$2519.40 non refundable, the HOLD expires tonight. Shall I book it? 

On Feb 14, 2015, at 4:39 PM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

please book same emirates biz seat for march 1 to 11 milan new york, 
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