
From: Lesley Gm 
To: Rich Kahn 

Subject: Re: FYI-from osc a 
Date: Fri, 26 Dec 2014 20:03:28 +0000 

agree...this is the time of year they count on to make their money I'm sure 

On Dec 26, 2014, at 2:58 PM, Richard Kahn - vrote: 

No worries. Thanks for your help with hotel. Looks like we will not have much luck in receiving credit. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 26, 2014, at 2:47 PM, Lesley Groff > wrote: 

ok, good deal...so I will go ahead and purchase and send you the tickets along with pricing details once I 
have it...thanks and hoping not to disturb you any more today! 

On Dec 26, 2014, at 2:31 PM, Richard ICah 

Yes 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 26, 2014, at 2:13 PM, Lesley Grof 

vrote: 

vrote: 

Can't we just send a check to amex when we normally pay the amex bill to cover this ticket ,but the check 
will be from the foundation for these particular tickets... 

On Dec 26, 2014, at 2:04 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

Probably best to send check to Amex if it has to be done today. Darren will not be happy but we probably 
have no choice. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 26, 2014, at 1:58 PM, Lesley Groff IMa. wrote: 
But we 

could the foundation pay JE back? or send a check to Amex bill for the flights? 

On Dec 26, 2014, at 1:57 PM, Richard Kahn > wrote: 

Only check or wire. 
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Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 26, 2014, at 1:36 PM, Lesley Groff < wrote: 

Rich, I am working on a ticket for joscha bach with Amex Centurian...Jeffity wants it paid for from 
the Foundation however...this is an extensive ticket (San Juan-STT STT-NY-London-Berlin 
Berlin-Munich (throw in his family now) Munich-Boston) Do we have a separate Credit Card for 
the Foundation that I could use? 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: FYI-from Joscha 
Date: December 26, 2014 at 1:33:06 PM EST 
To: Lesley Groff 

pay from foudntiaon 

On Fri, Dec 26, 2014 at 1:31 PM, Lesley Groff 
FYI... 

wrote: 

I would like to travel via Munich to Boston on the 21st of January, because I have a conference 
coming up in Munich from Jan 18-20. 
But on this trip, my family will come along. (I can give you their details, too, of course :) 

Thank you so much for your considerate help! 

Joscha 

Am 26.12.2014 um 19:12 schrieb Lesley Groff < 

Joscha...I am working on your ticket...want to investigate getting you back to Boston..what 
would be a good day for you to travel from Berlin to Boston? 
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