
From: 

To: Melanie Spinella 

Subject: Re: RE: 

Date: Fri, 19 Dec 2014 19:38:57 +0000 

Good deal 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 19, 2014, at 2:38 PM, Melanie Spinella 

Great- I will go back on Monday!)! 

From: M[mailto: 
Sent: Friday, December 19, 2014 2:37 PM 
To: Melanie Spinella 
Subject: Re: 

Yes!! It was purchased on Amex card! 
I hope they have it in your size! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 19, 2014, at 2:16 PM, Melanie Spinella < > wrote: 

> wrote: 

Hi - Jeffrey was so nice to get me a Loro Piana sweater, which is gorgeous — but way too big. When I went to get 
another size today — they need to know who purchased it — it's not on Jeffrey's account and until they know that, 
there's nothing they can do. I really love the sweater, but you and I could fit into it!!! Anything you can do to help?? 
thanks 

Melanie Spinella I Apollo Management 
9West 57th Street New York, New York 10019 
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