From: [ -
To: Larry Summers <[

Subject: Re: expenses -- Invoice 238 from LHSummers Economic Consulting LLC

Date: Thu, 20 Nov 2014 21:05:09 +0000

hmm. ...let me ask accounting..

on Nov 20, 2014, at 3:59 M, Sarah Mapes <|N S :o-:

*> We did receive the 1,135 but the involice total was 1233.25. Hot a huge difference but Jjust
have to make my accounts line up!

> om———— Criginal Message-----

> From: [N (~a:lco: I
> Sent: Thursday, Nowvember 20, 2014 3:5E PM

> To: Sarah Mapes

> S5ub

RFa: expenses -- Invoice 238 from LHSummers Economic Consulting LLC
» Sarah...did you have an incoming wire fee from your bank taken from the total? the
accounting dept sent 51125.65 to larry's account...

> on Nov 20, 2014, at 10:26 AM, Sarah Mapes <[ :ot-:

#» I wanted to let you know that we ication of payment! I have one
gquestion though -- the payment 1s just under the total of the inveoice for £1,195.65. Do you
know 1f there was an item on the inveice that wasn't covered or was that just a mistake?

Wanted to check so I can make sure my reporting is correct.

-

uick

| =4

o

»> Thanks!
»>» Sarah

rom———- COriginal Message—-----

»» From: Sarah Mapes

»> Sent: Wednesday, MNovember 05, 2014 12:18 EM
T . 1 []

»» Subject: RE: expenses -- Invoice 238 from LHSummers Economic Consulting LLC

»» Perfect! Thank you -- it is attached! Could you ferward it on to the appropriate people?

rom———- COriginal Message—-----

>> From: [ (~a:1co:

»» Sent: Tuesday, November 04, 2014 5:14 PM

»» To: Sarah Mapes

»» Subject: Re: expenses —-- Invoice 238 from LHSummers Economic Consulting LLC

»» Jeffrey says to invoice S5TC! (Southern Trust Company)

== 5TC
!
ot
ot

>> On Nov 4, 2014, at 3:44 BM, Sarah Mapes <[ :ot-:

-

»»>» Here you go! Let me know what you both think.
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N
»»>» Thanks!!

e

Er ————— Original Message

»»>» Sent: Tuesday, MHovember DJ 2014 3:34 PBM

»»> To: Sarah Mapes

»»> Subject: Re: expenses

N

»»» Jjust thought I would share with Jeffrey so he i1s able to figure ocut guickly...
e

»»» On Nov 4, 2014, at 3:32 PM, Sarah Mapes _ wrote:

e

»»> 0Oh I hadn't attached anything yet! I haven't made up the invoice just yet. Can make and
zend to you if easier!

N

PR —--—— Original Message----—-

#»»>» Sent: Tuesday, HNovember 04, 2014 3:31 FM

»»»>» To: Sarah Mapes

x> Zubject: Re: expenses

R

»r»>> Hi Sarah...I will need to find ocut! Can you send the attachment another way? I can't
open winmail docs...you can just copy and paste in an email to me if wyou like!

BEn

»»>>» Thanks, -

e e

»rr» On Nov 4, 2014, at 3:24 PM, Sarah Mapes f:_'.*: wrote:

e

===>> | R

e e el

»»x>> Larry has a couple of expensez from flying to NY last month for the dinner on the 8th.
What is the best company name for me to put down on an invoice? Larry mentioned it was ckay
to send to Jeffrey. Thanks for letting us know!

S S e

»»»>> Sarah
e

»»»>»>» Sarah Map
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»»» <Inv_ 238 from LHZSummers Econemic Consulting LLC 18748.pdf><Scanned from a Xerox
Multifunction Device.pdf>
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