
From: Richard Kahn  
To: 

Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 
Date: Thu, 20 Nov 2014 20:24:51 +0000 

ok great 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Nov 20, 2014, at 3:22 PM, > wrote: 

Rich, says by the time she booked her flight the exchange rate had changed and the price became 
3600USD... 

On Nov 19, 2014, at 5:09 PM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 

sorry to be pain but email says jee wants to book for 3800 yet invoice is for 3600 
please advise 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Nov 19, 2014, at 5:00 PM, 

Will do now 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 19, 2014, at 4:56 PM, Richard Kahn < 

wrote: 

wrote: 

EFTA00358665



you can inform 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

that wire will be sent in am 

On Nov 19, 2014, at 4:53 PM, 

ok, great 

wrote: 

On Nov 19, 2014, at 4:48 PM, Richard Kahn c:a wrote: 

think i found name 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Nov 19, 2014, at 3:15 PM, 

bank details: 

The SWIFT/ BIC number is: 

My bank's address is: 

Also, my contact information: 

Name: 
Email: 
Telephonenumber: 

wrote: 

EFTA00358666



Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 
Date: November 19, 2014 at 3:03:01 PM EST 
To: 

Dear Ent 
I hope that you are well today! 
I have attached the receipt of my ticket; if you need my bank information again or any other 
information, just let me know. I am sorry that the receipt is written in Swedish and the amount (28 
203,00 kr, approx 3600 USD) is in Swedish kronor. Also, sorry for not being able to get back to you 
earlier than now. 
I have written and said it several times by now (both to you and to Jeffrey), but I cannot enough 
emphasize how grateful and happy I am for this. THANK YOU. 
Have a good afternoon! 

On Tue, Nov 18, 2014 at 9:31 PM, 
> wrote: 

And, THANK YOU! 
Have a good afternoon! 
•K 111 

On Tue, Nov 18, 2014 at 10:01 PM, 
very good! thanks 

On Nov 18, 2014, at 3:36 PM, 
> wrote: 

wrote: 

Dear =I, 
I just wanted to let you know that I have booked the ticket, but, that the ticket has not yet been 
processed. (This as I booked it through a Swedish booking agency just before closing time. I 
do, however, have the booking reference). I get back to you tomorrow again. 
Have a good afternoon and evening. 
Also, THANK you very much for all your help, 

On Tue, Nov 18, 2014 at 4:53 PM, 
great :) 

On Nov 18, 2014, at 10:40 AM, 
> wrote: 

DeR 
THANK YOU so very very very much. I am speechless! 
I get back to you shortly! 

> wrote: 

EFTA00358667



On Tuesday, November 18, 2014, > wrote: 
..I am still on the other line but wanted to get back to you ASAP! Jeffrey would 

like you to book the trip for $3800!!! :) 

YAE! so book your trip and please send me the invoice so Rich can wire you the 
money... 

Thanks, 

.pdf> 
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