From: Jason Milligan *’_‘-*
To: [
Subject: RE: William Pitt invoice
Date: Thu, 13 Nov 2014 21:56:51 +0000
Inline-Images: image001.jpg; image002, jpg; image003.png; image(004.png; imagel05.png

If you sell it to this guy | will take a fee @ | know you two don’t really want to sell but he mentioned that he may want to
buy yours or another house eventually.

This guy seems great.

Jason Milligan
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From: IR (maitco: I

Sent: Thursday, November 13, 2014 4:34 PM
To: Jason Milligan

Cc:

Subject: Re: William Pitt invoice

I have printed the invoice and will send in mail with check today.. Ike, does it need to come from Redhawk
check book or can [ write from Bankwell account? That 1s incredibly nice of you to wave your fee for us
Jason...we do appreciate all vou have done. Really happy to have what seems to be a good tenant! ...

On Nov 13, 2014, at 4:28 PM, Jason Milligan ﬂ_l'f wrote:

Can you please pay the attached invoice directly to William Pitt. Include a copy of the invoice when you mail it.
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As | mentioned. My fee is waived. Sorry it took so long to rent.

Thanks.

Jason Milligan

Broker
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