From: [
To: [N -
Subject: Re: please confirm receipt ;)

Date: Wed, 01 Oct 2014 15:52:35 +0000

Hi - Around what time do you think you will go by the house? I want to tell -
Thanks!

Sent from my iPFhone

on occt 1, 2014, at 10:53 2M, | N - - -
» Thank you -I i will drop off at Jeffrey's house this afterncon!

> I enjoy NYC so much that i can't think of coming bac

> Sent from my iFhone

e

»» Hi -I Jeffrey says to watch as many movies as you like, his treat!!

T

»» Our office address is 575 Lexington ave, 4th floor. We are between 5lst and 52Znd. If more
convenient, You could also drop off at Jeffrev's house at 9 East 7lst street between 5th and
Madison. Or even more convenient, give to -a: “he apartments. :)

e

»» Whatewver works for you!! Just let me know as I will need to tell the front desk at our

office or - at the house to expect you!!

e

»» Hope you are enjoying HY!!

#» S5ent from my iFPhone

=»» On Sep 30, 2014, at 2:49 PM, _ <_;~ Wrote:

e

»»>» Thank you for all information - ' ¢} I think i will make it to your office to leave
a gift for Jeffrey and little suwvenier for you!

»»» 1 just don't know the address of your office.

e

2w -, we've bought a movie on TV in apartment, 1 thought i can pay by adding a credit
card info and to pay 15.9%5 but it was paid automaticly. we own these money for a movie.

e

> See you soon!

e

R

e

2> Bent from my iFhone

3>

rr>» On 29 Sep 2014, at 17:15, "_‘> Wwrote:

BrEE

»r»»>» Also, I should be working from the office on Wednesday if wyou wanted to pop over. But
please don't feel pressure ...this is your holiday! Many of Jeffrey's assistants live right
at the apartments and if it easier teo give your sweet gift to one of them to give to me that
totally works!

e

»»»> Zent from my iPhone

B

EFTA00361463



=»»>> on Sep 29, 2014, at 4:35 M, || NN < it
e

=2 | R

R

#r»x»>»>» I received tickets, thank you so much!!!

R

e -

et

»>»>»>> LRent from my iPhone
e

FrR>>> 0On 29 Sep 2014, at 14:3

E
=rrxr»>> Hi -...:'_r.a:s-:.- confirm recelipt of your tickets to Cabaret! thanks, -

EFTA00361464



