From: Lesley Groff <] -

To: Rich Kahn < -

Ce: Bella Klein <
Subject: Re:
Date: Wed, 17 Sep 2014 12:33:40 +0000

[ think she 15 paying herself and getting reimbursed, but Bella will need to confirm

for her...she has booked all her own flights...

On Sep 17, 2014, at 8:21 AM, Richard Kahn *i_* wrote:

Was she paying for al travel on her end or did we put anything on our credit cards?

From: Lesley Groff <[ G-
Date: Wed, 17 Sep 2014 07:56:49 -0400

To: Richard Kahn <[
Ce: bellaklein <| G -

Subject: Re: FW:

| can help assist in dates she has traveled She does not send me her expense reports.

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 17, 2014, at 7:26 AM, Richard Kahn <} - ot

...I have not paid for anything

Jee would like a calculation on all out of pocket expenses spent to date on ij{air, cars, hotels, etc)

Can you both please help me assemble
Thank you

From: leffrey Epstein <jeevacation®@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, 17 Sep 2014 07:20:09 -0400

To: Richard Kahn </

if you have not dealt with il yet, first calcuatle and tell me how much out of pocket we have spent on her tickets? etc
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