
From: ==l > 

To: Bella Klein 

Subject: Re: Citicar recent invoice 

Date: Wed, 27 Aug 2014 15:59:07 +0000 

that is true.. 
she was in customs for a long time. I made them go back for her. I had asked them not to go 
upon arrival of the flight..gave her a 40 minute window I believe..and it still was way 
longer and a mess. 

On Aug 27, 2014, at 11:54 AM, bellaklein •< > wrote: 

> please email details on Lenkova waiting time - if you know anything specific... $148.., 
Citicar told me that they send the driver away and we called him back to return?,,, 

> • Thank you, 
> Bella 

> • Tel: 

> On Aug 27, 2014, at 11:51 AM, > wrote: 

>> hmm, ok so we actually rec'd decent pricing from citicar 
>> 
>> On Aug 27, 2014, at 11:45 AM, bellaklein <  wrote: 
>> 
>>> <SHBRK Scann14082711200.pdf> 
>> 
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