From: [
To: Bella Klein <

Subject: Fwd: Hertz Rental for Mariana
Date: Fri, 29 Aug 2014 15:23:25 +0000

below verification of JE confirming Mariana can be reimbursed for car rental 1f she uses her own card.

Begin forwarded message:

From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com=
Subject: Re: Hertz Rental for Mariana

Date: August 27, 2014 at 2:13:07 PM EDT
To: —

she can put on her card an be reimbursed

On Wed, Aug 27, 2014 at 2:11 PM, —* wrote:

below from amex centurion rep:

Called Avis and Enterprise and the person who picks up the vehicle has to be the same person who pays
for the rental.

Sixt Car Rental only allows pre-payment in their web site, but it is too late, they require 5 days prior

Auto Europe, has availability through Thrifty, for an intermediate car, similar to a Toyota Venice, with alc
and automatic, including only basic insurance (liability and fire, no collision nor damage waweri, with

taxes and
fees for $3130.73, 33 days, pick up is noon, return is noon, 30Aug/020ct

Let me know...

On Aug 27, 2014, at 12:44 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacationfagmail.com™> wrote:
she shoud check otther long term rentals places. also the price of a used car.

On Wed, Aug 27, 2014 at 12:43 PM. || GG - o
Unfortunate%y we cannot just extend the car rental for Mariana with Hertz, we must make a new
reservation for Aug. 30-Oct. 2

We have to alert Mariana to go to the Hertz office on August 30th and re-check the vehicle.

New prepaid rate from August 30th (around noon local time) to October 2nd (3pm local time) for same
type of vehicle she has, is $4099.20 including all taxes, fees, and mandatory insurance required.

Just waiting for the new voucher and confirmation. will send to you once | receive.

On Aug 27, 2014, at 8:38 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacationfrgmail com> wrote:

Il plcase make sure mariana has the car thru oct
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