
From: 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: NYAA Painting is at 71st 

Date: Fri, 01 Aug 2014 20:11:18 +0000 

Below from Liz Hobson: 

What great newsl 
It's the same size as the one he already purchased (48 x 36 inches) and is priced the same. I believe the artist had it listed 
at $15,000 but offered it to Jeffrey for $10,000. 
Let me know how he'd prefer to pay for it (check or credit card). I can do a cc today if that is easiest I 

Liz 

On Aug 1, 2014, at 3:03 PM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Yes 

On Fri, Aug I, 2014 at 11:38 AM, wrote: 
Janusz has picked up the painting you purchased and brought back to the house. Liz Hobson was asking if 
you might be interested in the artists sister piece to the art you bought. 
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