From: "Narovec, Nicole L XEROX" _?

To: Larr".r Visoski < , GP SIK AAG Flight Ops < =, Darren Indyke
. Rich Kahn

Ce: _ "Arciga, Raul XEROX" <[

Subject: RE: [External] Epstein Charter
Date: Mon, 28 Jul 2014 19:30:00 +0000

Hi Larry,

Yes, everything regarding the £$12,626.40 is taken care of.
Thank you =0 much, and have a lowvely day

Nicole Narowvec

Accounts Receivable Analwyst

Helicopter Support, Inc.
A 5i ; -

WARNING: THE INFORMATIOW IN THIS TRANSMISSION IS CONFIDENTIAL AND IS MEANT TO BE READ AND
Q3ED OMLY BY THE INTENDED RECIPIENT. ENCLOSED COMMODITIES, TECHMICAL DATA OR SOFTWARE ARE
SUBJECT TO THE EXPORT CONWTROL OF EITHER THE INTERMATICHAL TRAFFIC IN ABMS REGULATIONS (ITAR)
OF THE EXPORT ADMINISTRATION REGULATIONS (EAR) AND CANMOT BE EXPCRTED WITHCUT THE
AUTHORIEZATION COF EITHEE THE DEPARTMENT CF STATE CR THE DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE PRIOR TO
EXPORT. EXPORT INCLUODES DISCLOSURE AND OR ACCESS TO COMMODITIES, TECHMICAL DATA OR S0FTWARE
BY FOREIGHN MATIONALS WHETHER LOCATED IN THE UNITED STATES OR ABRCAD. THIS REQUIREMENT
APPLIES EQUALLY TO FOREIGH HWATIOWAL EMPLOYEES OF 0.5, COMEANIES AND THEIR FOREIGH
SUBSIDIARIES. THI= DOCUMENT, OR AW EMBODIMENT OF IT IN ANY MEDIAR, DISCLOSES INFORMATION
WHICH IS5 PROPRIETARY, IS THE PROPERTY OF SIKCORSEY AIRCRAFT CORPORATION AND/SOR ITS
SUBSIDIARIES, IS AN UNPUBLISHED WORE PROTECTED UNDER APPLICABLE COPYRIGHT LAWS, AND IS
DELIVERED ON THE EXPFRESS COWDITICW THAT IT IS NOT TO BE USED, DISCLOSEDR, REPRODOCED, IN WHOLE
OR IN PART (INCLUDING REPRODUCTION AS A DERIVATIVE WOREK), OR USED FOR MANUFACTURE FOR ANYOHE
OTHER THAMN SIKCESEY AIRCRAFT CORPORATICHN AND/OR ITS SUBSIDIARIES WITHOUT ITS WRITTEN COMNSENT,
AND THAT MO RIGHT IS GEAMNTED TO DISCLOSE OR 50 U“E ANY INFORMATICH COMTAINED HEREIN. ALL
RIGHTS RESERVED. ANY ACT IN VIOLATIOM OF APPLICABLE LAW MAY RESULT IN CIVIL AND CRIMINAL
PENALTIES. ANY REVIEW, USE, DISSEMIMNATION, DISTRIEUTION OFR COPYING OF THIS TRANSMITTAL EBEY AN
OHINTEHMDED RECIPIENT IS STRICTLY PROHIBITED, AND MAY BE A VIOLATIOW OF LAW SUBJECT TOC

PEHNALTY

————— Original Message-----

From: Larry Visoskil jmailtn:_]

Sent: Monday, July 28, 2014 1Z:16 FM

To: GP SIEK AAG Flight Qps; MNarowvec, MNicole L XERCK; Darren Indyke; Rich Kahn

Zubject: [External] Epstein Charter

E

Hello Dan, ARG

Approved and confirmed for Wednesday B:30am to Mr. Woody Allan's home.,

At this time it's B:30am departure from East side NYC pad to Mr Allan's home with a 5:00pm
pickup back to NYC., I will confirm tomorrow 1f Mr. Epstein will add the Bard collage stop to
his itinerary., Fls find attached signed contract.,

EFTA00365953



Micole can you confirm that our HSI $12,626.40 balance was transferred to AAG already?
I will pay balance of this Charter on my AMX card preovided in your gquote.,

EFTA00365954



