From: Lvjet <] G-
To: [N D .
Subject: Re: [External] Epstein Charter
Date: Mon, 28 Jul 2014 19:33:32 +0000

Hi Dan,

| just spoke to Jim at KPVD Providence Airport operations who issues landing permission for m home,
GREAT guy, he will contact you direct with approvals and Fire dept notice in case there is need, eic,. He will also contact Mr.
Allen's assistant Gini for Home landing permission from owner.

nis number i

all is maoving Fwd at this time

thix
Larry

-—--Original Message-----
From: GP SIK AAG Fli
To: Larry Visoski <
Cc: GP SIK AAG Flight Ops <
Sent: Mon, Jul 28, 2014 3:27 pm
Subject: RE: [External] Epstein Charter

Sounds good! I look forward to hearing from you tomorrow. Regards, Dan Frost Flight Operations

] Sent: Monday, July 28, 2014 3:16 FM Tao:

=; Rich EKahn Cc: _ Subje

=d and confirmed for Wedne: B:30am to Mr.

yeiated Aircraft Group Email:
Larry Visoskl [mailto:
5; Narowves, Nicole L XEROX; Darren Indy

GF

Iy

[External] ] Chart Helle Dan, AAG Appro
EBllan's home., 75 Gray Craig Read, Middletown RI, (02842 At this time it's
side HYC pad to Mr Allan's home with a 5:00pm pickup back to NYC., I will confirm tomorrow if Mr.

Epstein will add the Bard collage stop to his i1tinerary., Pls find attached signea contract., Nicole

i0am departure from East

can yoeu confirm that ocur HSI $12,626.40 balance was transferred to AAG already? I will pay balance

ot this Charter on my AMX card provided in your guote.,

EFTA00365956



