
From: Sue Caffrey 

To: ==l ' 
Subject: RE: I might have to cancel Wed! 

Date: Mon, 28 Jul 2014 19:33:07 +0000 

Oh no! I was so looking forward to it. :( 
Next week I could do Tuesday, Wed. or Thursday but not Monday. Do any of those days work? 

Sue Anne Caffrey 
Sr. Account Manager 
Lease Administration 

T +1 (908) 236 7477 
M +1 (908) 310 3466 

Cushman & Wakefield of New Jersey, Inc 
1150 Headquarters Plaza, Morristown, NJ 07960 

Driven! C&W's 2011/2012 Annual Review: now available online 

 Original Message 
From: [mailto: 
Sent: Monday, July 28, 2014 3:27 PM 
To: Sue Caffrey 
Subject: I might have to cancel Wed! 

Sue,...I can't believe this! Life is getting in the way of my having a nice dinner with 
you!! It is looking like WEd will not work...Ike has stuff going on and I need to be 
home...arg! Could you do Monday Aug 4? if not then we need to look at week of Aug. 11 
because we are going to Atlantis Aug. 6! Woo Hoo...in need of a nice vacation. If something 
changes with this Wed. I will let you know...and sometimes it does when it comes to 
Ike....but I wanted you to know sooner rather than later... 

so very sorry...truly.. 

Les 
See Notice Regarding Email Communication from Cushman & Wakefield: 
http://www.cushmanwakefield.com/en/terms-of-use/ <http://www.cushmanwakefield.com/en/terms-
of-use/> and http://www.cushmanwakefield.com/en/privacy-statement/ 
<http://www.cushmanwakefield.com/en/privacy-statement/>.. 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be privileged and is 
intended for the exclusive use of the above named addressee(s). If you are not the intended 

recipient(s). you are expressly prohibited from copying, distributing, disseminating, or in 
any other way using any information contained within this communication. If you have received 
this communication in error please contact the sender by telephone or by response via mail. 

We have taken precautions to minimize the risk of transmitting software viruses, but we 
advise you to carry out your own virus checks on any attachment to this message. We cannot 
accept liability for any loss or damage caused by software viruses. 
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