From: Lesley Groff <] -
To: Kelly Palumbo - S
Cet e Grorr - I

Subject: Re: Lesley & Daniel Groff-Redhawk Partners LLC
Date: Fr1, 11 Jul 2014 18:09:53 +0000

Crreat. Thanks.

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 11, 2014, at 2:05 PM, Kelly Palumbo _ wrote:

Hi Lesley and lke,

| completed the Operating Agreement and Marc just needs to review it. | will get it over once he has had a chance to look

it owver.
Thanks!

Kelly Palumbo

Assistant to David W. Stergas, Esq.
DePanfilis & Vallerie, LLC

25 Belden Avenue

Morwalk, CT 06850

Ph: 203-846-9585

Fax: 203-847-2849

From: Lesley Groff [mailto: |

Sent: Friday, July 11, 2014 1:55 PM

To: Kelly Palumbo

Ce: Tke Groff

Subject: Re: Lesley & Daniel Groff-Redhawk Partners LLC

Excellent. Thanks

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 11, 2014, at 1:50 PM, Kelly Palumbo _'—'-* wrote:

Hi Lesley ,

| am working on it now. | will have it over in a few.

Kelly Palumbo

Assistant to David W. Stergas , Esqg.
DePanfilis & Vallerie, LLC

25 Belden Avenue

Morwalk , CT 08850

Ph: 203-846-9585

Fax: 203-847-2849

From: Lesley Groff [mailto: |

Sent: Friday, July 11, 2014 1:42 PM
To: Kelly Palumbo
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Ce: Ike Groff
Subject: Re: Lesley & Daniel Groff-Redhawk Partners LLC

Kelly can you please confirm our request to have marc draw up the operating agreement for Redhawk
Partners LLC? We would like this as soon as possible. Thanks, Lesley

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 9, 2014 , at 4:11 PM , Kelly Palumbo </} A - ot

Hi Lesley ,

I spoke with Marc and he let me know the legal fee for drafting the Operating Agreement 15 5250.00. Let me know if you would
like to proceed and | would be happy to get that over to vou asap.

Thanks!

Kelly Palumbo

Assistant to David W. Stergas , Esq.
DePanfilis & Vallerie, LLC

25 Belden Avenue

Morwalk . CT 06850

Ph: 203-846-9585

Fax: 203-847-2849

=====(Jriginal Message=se--

From: Lesley Groff [mailto-| | G
Sent: Wednesday, July 09, 2014 10:07 AM

To: Kelly Palumbo

Ce: Ike Groff

Subject: Lesley & Daniel Groff-Redhawk Partners LLC

Hello Kelly . We are trying to open a checking account for Redhawk Partners LLC and are being told we need to provide the
bank with:

=The Operating Agreement

=Articles of Organization

A letter from the state confirming the Federal Employer (Tax 1D) Number
Might you be able to provide this so we may open the checking account?
Thank you,

Lesley Groff

917 749 2025

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTE

The documents accompanying this lelecopy tranamission may contaln confidential or privileged information from the Law Firm of DaPanfilis &
Vallerie, LLC. This information is intended for use only by the individual or entity named on this ransmission sheat If you are not the intended
reciplent, be aware that any disclosure, copying, distribution of use of the contents of this information i2 prohibited. If you have recaived this
talecopy in error, please notify us by telephone immadiately at (203) 846-9585 so that we can arrange for retrieval of the transmitted documents.

IM CASE OF TROUBLE WITH THIS TRAMSMISSION, PLEASE CALL 203 846-8585.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTE
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The documents accompanying this telecopy transmission may contain confidential or privileged information from the Law Firm of DaFPanifilis &
Vallerie, LLC. This Information is intended for use only by the individual or entity named on this transmizslon sheel If you are not the intended
recipient, be aware that any disclosure, copying. distribution or use of the contents of this information iz prohibited. If yvou have recaived this elecopy
in error, please notify us by telephone immediately at {203) 846-9585 so that we can arrange for retrieval of the transmiited documents.

IN CASE OF TROUBLE WITH THIS TRANSMISSION, PLEASE CALL 203 B46-8585.
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTE

The documents accompanying this telecopy transmission may contain confidential or privileged information from the Law Firm of DeFPanifilis & Vallerie,
LG This information is intended for use only by the individual ar entity named on this ransmission sheet. If you are not the intended reciplent, be

aware that any disclosure, copying, distribution or use of the contents of this information iz prohibited. If yvou have received this telecopy in error, please
notify us by telephone immediately at (203) B46-9585 so that we can arrange for retriieval of the transmitted documents.

IN CASE OF TROUBLE WITH THIS TRANSMISSION, PLEASE CALL 203 846-5585.
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