
From: ' on behalf of Second 2 None Installation 

To: Lesley Groff Mina 
Cc:' aileen 

, mitch 
Subject: Re: relocation of gym equipment s/o 4466047 

Date: Tue, 10 Jun 2014 13:49:20 +0000 

Great your confirmed. 

On Tue, Jun 10, 2014 at 7:41 AM, Lesley Groff < 
Tuesday July 1 from 12-4 is great! See you then. Thanks Lesley 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 9, 2014, at 7:00 PM, Second 2 None Installation < > wrote: 

Hi Lesley, 

wrote: 

Currently we have Tuesday July I available between 12pm-4pm or 2pm -6pm. Please let we if this is 
convenient for you. 

Thanks 

Nikki 

On Mon, Jun 9, 2014 at 4:58 PM, lesley taylor < > wrote: 
Hi Nikki... can you please change the date of our relocation of our Home Gym to July lnd? 

Lesley 

Date: Fri, 30 May 2014 12:36:57 -0400 

Subject: Re: relocation of m e uipment s/o 4466047 
From: 
To: 
CC: • 

Yes we do accept Amex. 

On Fri, May 30, 2014 at 12:27 PM, lesley taylor < wrote: 

Great! We do not need the maintenance package, but thank you. 
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If the date of our move changes, I will of course let you know as soon as possible, but things look very 
good for June 24th move. 

Do you take Amex? I can call you with my info if you could pass along your phone number:. 

thanks, Lesley 

Date: Fri, 30 May 2014 11:02:19 -0400 

Subject: Re: relocation of m e uipment s/o 4466047 
From: 
To: 
CC: •

Hi Leslie, 

Congratulations on your new home. 

We can complete your relocation on Tuesday June 24 between 12pm-4pm. Please confirm if you want 
the maintenance package that Patty offered you. I would just need payment in full to lock the date in for 
you. 

I look forward to hearing from you, 

Thanks 

Nikki 

On Fri, May 30, 2014 at 10:54 AM, lesley taylor > wrote: 

Tremendous...thanks 

HI Aileen and Nikki... would it be possible to get on your schedule for Tues. June24th? We have this 
as our tentative move in date to our new home...As the date approaches I will have a better sense of 
the date is firm. thanks, Lesley 

> From: 
> To: 
> CC 
> Date: Fri, 30 May 2014 14:51:11 +0000 

> Subject: Re: relocation of gym equipment s/o 4466047 

> Hi Lesley, 

> Aileen and Nikki will be able to assist you with the relocation. Both are captioned on this email and 
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will refer to the pricing we discussed below. 

> Have a great day, 

> Patty Mandel 
> Director of Client Services 
> Fitness Showrooms 

> Please visit our website at: 
> www.fitnessshowrooms.com 

> Confidentiality Notice: This email transmission is intended solely for the parties to whom it has 
been specifically addressed. Use or dissemination of this information by parties other than those 
specified in the "to" section of this email is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in 
error, do not print or copy it or any attachments hereto. Immediately delete it in its entirety and notify 
me at 

>> > Original Message-----
> >From: lesley taylor [mailto: 
> >Sent: Friday, May 30, 2014 09:39 AM 
>> To: pmandel(afitnessshowrooms.com 
> >Subject: RE: relocation of gym equipment s/o 4466047 

> >Hi Pam...I would like to hire you to move our Parabody GS4 from our current home to our new 
home tentatively for Tues. June 24th!! Please let me know the next step. 
> >Current home: , New Canaan 
>  home: New Canaan(the homes are about 1 mile apart in town) 
»Thanks, Lesley 

>» From: 
>» To: 
>» CC: 
>>> Date: Thu, 8 May 2014 16:06:37 +0000 
>>> Subject: Re: relocation of gym equipment s/o 4466047 
>>> 
>» Hi Lesley, 
>>> 
>>> 
>>> For us to disassemble, relocate and reassemble the Parabody GS4 from one location to another 
is $695.00 plus tax. 
>>> 
>>> 
>>> We also offer a preventative maintenance. 
>>> 
>>> A preventative maintenance is a cleaning, lubrication and adjustment of the 
>>> unit. When you have this completed, we extend a one year labor warranty to you. 
>>> 
>» If you should need service throughout the year, you would not be charged any 
>» labor rates. However, parts are not included unless covered under your 
>>> manufacturer part warranty. Normally the rate for this service is $595.00 plus tax. When you 
schedule this in conjunction with a relocation I can reduce the rate to $200.00 plus tax. 
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»> 
»> Please let me know if you would like to schedule this service. 
»> 
»> Patty Mandel 
»> Director of Client Services 
»> Fitness Showrooms 
> » 
> » Please visit our website at: 
>» www.fitnessshowrooms.com 
»> 
»> 
>>> Confidentiality Notice: This email transmission is intended solely for the parties to whom it has 
been specifically addressed. Use or dissemination of this information by parties other than those 
specified in the "to" section of this email is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in 
error, do not print or copy it or any attachments hereto. Immediately delete it in its entirety and notify 
me at 
»> 
»> 
»> 
>>> >-----Original Message 
>>> >From: lesley taylor [mailto 
> >> >Sent: Thursday, May 8, 2014 11:28 AM 
> >»To: 
>>> >Cc: 'ike groff Groff 
>>> >Subject: RE: relocation of gym equipment s/o 4466047 
>>» 
>>> >Hi Patty and thank you for getting back to me...sorry I am at work and the cell service has not 
been working well today. We have a Parabodiodel #GS4-104. It is one of those "home gym" 
machines. All the moving companies I have quotes from say I need to have this professionally 
taken apart and professionally reassembled...they can move it in its parts only for us. We are looking 
to move beginning of June. Might you be able to provide me a quote? We live at in 
New Canaan and are moving one mile down the road to  Thanks so much, Lesley 
Groff 
>>» 
> >> » From: 
»»> To: 
> >> » Date: Thu, 8 May 2014 15:16:16 +0000 
> >> » Subject: relocation of gym equipment s/o 4466047 
> » » 
> » » Hi Lesley, 
> » » 
> >> » I can help you with the relocation of your gym. 
> » » 
>>> >> Who is the manufacturer and what is the model number? 
> » » 
> >> » I look forward to hearing from you, 
> » » 
»»> Patty Mandel 
> >> » Director of Client Services 
> >> » Fitness Showrooms 
> » » 
> >> >> Please visit our website at: 
> » » www.fitnessshowrooms.com 
> » » 
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> » » 
> >> >> Confidentiality Notice: This email transmission is intended solely for the parties to whom it 
has been specifically addressed. Use or dissemination of this information by parties other than those 
specified in the "to" section of this email is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in 
error, do not print or copy it or any attachments hereto. Immediately delete it in its entirety and notify 
me at 
> » » 
> » » 
> » » 
> » » 
>>» 
»> 
»> 

Nikki Francis 
Operations Manager 
Second 2 None Ent. 
P.O. Box 1498 
Baldwin. NY 11510 

Nikki Francis 
Operations Manager 
Second 2 None Ent. 
P.O. Box 1498 
Baldwin. NY 11510 

Nikki Francis 
Operations Manager 
Second 2 None Ent. 
P.O. Box 1498 
laldwiinnsm NY 11510 
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Nikki Francis 
Operations Manager 
Second 2 None Ent. 
P.O. Box 1498 
Baldwin. NY 11510 
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