
From: Lesley Groff 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeeyacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: Re: Dr. Fallahphour 
Date: Sun, 27 Apr 2014 21:21:50 +0000 

Below from Dr. Fallahpour re . let me 
know if I should make the additional appt for the 9th after you read: 

Let's have her come in on the 9th. About a we we should have 
if the report (or sooner). Then we can plan for th if she still 

wants to proceed with that. As for additional fees, we w: cap it at $1000 as agreed before. 
We had to do a few additional test since we may need to rely more on 
attentional issues rather than Dyslexia. I will explain more once I have the 
report. We are trying to find the best approach 

We can discuss by phone next week if needed. 

On Apr 27, 2014, at 12:44 PM, Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

maybe another time , lets see the accomodation letter 

On Sun, Apr 27, 2014 at 12:43 PM, Lesley Groff IMINal wrote: 
See below...I asked him to please break out what the cost of just the additional test would be... 

The cost for thel is $2500. 
However, these tests are not necessary for her school accommodation letter. 

I will need to give her a few instructions as to how to prepare for the 
test. It is non intrusive and there is no radiation involved in these maps. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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