
From: 

To: "Kamran Fallahpour, PhD" Ma. 

Subject: Re: Dyslexia Test for 

Date: Tue, 08 Apr 2014 20:48:54 +0000 

I will get back to you regarding a check or CC...I could probably have the check brought over 
to you tomorrow...Unfortunately, I don't think has any documentation with her. Her 
cell number is: 

She has been in our time zone for over a week and is acclimated... 

I will be in touch one I hear back from my employer...you can reach me at 

thanks, 

On Apr 8, 2014, at 4:38 PM, Kamran Fallahpour, PhD wrote: 

> Hi 

> • Yes. Please make the check payable to the Brain Resource Center. 
> Please FedEx the check to us ASAP since we need to receive prior to 
> appointment date given that it is in a few days. 
> Alternatively, you can call our front desk at and arrange for 
> credit card payment. 

> I will email you with the details of time and location but it would be at 
> either one of the locations: 

> • The Brain Resource Center 
> 263 West End Ave. #1D 
> NY, NY 10023 
> Corner of 72nd and West End 

> Or 

> 315 Madison Ave (at 42nd St.) 
> Suite 506 
> New York, NY 10017 

> • I will email you by tomorrow to give you exact time and details. 

> • If she has any prior records and testing please have her bring a copy. If 
> she has no prior testing records, no problem. 

> • Please also email us your contact information as well as her mobile if 
> available. 
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> 
> 
> 
> 
> 
> On 4/8/14 4:24 PM, " .sf > wrote: 
> 
>> Hello Dr. Fallahpour. Thank you so very much for getting back to me. The 
» girl who will be coming to see you is: 
» 
» 
» Birth date: 
» 
» She goes by ....Can you give me the east side address for your 
>> facility? I see only the address for the West side: 
» 
» 263 W. End Ave. #1D 
» 
>> What time would you like to arrive? What time do you think she 
>> will be finished. We will get you a check for $3500. Do we make it out 
>> to The Brain Resource? 
» 
» Thank you, 
» 
> 
> <Unknown-3[1][1].png> 
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