
From: Lesley Groff <MIElle 
To: bellaklein 

Subject: Re: amex 
Date: Wed, 09 Apr 2014 14:34:30 +0000 

call them...1 don't know why there is a cc charge. i did not give them a cc...don't know anything about it. 

On Apr 9, 2014, at 10:33 AM, bellaklein •::a> wrote: 

no, copy of the credit card charge... 
On Apr 9, 2014, at 10:31 AM, Lesley Groff a> wrote: 

call them...? what is this an invoice they sent you? 

On Apr 9, 2014, at 10:31 AM, bellaklein c wrote: 

but i sent a check...from enhanced? 
On Apr 9, 2014, at 10:28 AM, Lesley Groff c wrote: 

table for 10 JE bought...it was this past Monday night.. 

On Apr 9, 2014, at 10:24 AM, bellaklein la> wrote: 

NEW YORK ACADEMY OF NEW YORK NY 

Do you have info on the above charge? 
Txs 

JEFFREY E EPSTEIN 12.000.00 
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