
From: Lesley Groff <1 
To: Bella Klein

Subject: Fwd: Tribeca ball donation 
Date: Thu, 20 Mar 2014 15:22:12 +0000 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Tribeca ball donation 
Date: March 20, 2014 10:15:18AM EDT 
To: Lesley Groff < 

mt ) 

it will be from enhanced 
no need to ask as it will probably upset him 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

On Mar 20, 2014, at 10:14 AM, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 

ok, thanks...I will ask JE from what fund he wants to purchase the table or him personally once I get the info 
from the Tribeca Ball pp... 

Not sure if we bought a table last year... ? 

On Mar 20, 2014, at 9:37 AM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

this was from 2 years ago 
it appears we may not have done last year?? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 
cel 

Begin forwarded message: 

EFTA00372766



From: < 
Subject: Tribeca ball donation 
Date: March 8, 2012 4:26:45 PM EST 
To: "'Richard Kahn" 
Cc: "'Cecile de Jongh"' 

Rich 

, "'Darren Indyke"' < 

JEE just authorized the attached $25,000 for the tribeca ball from JEVIF. We have cut the check in STT and will 
send tomorrow with the backup/invitation. DKI is only signatory on this account. 

JEVIF needs funding current first bank balance 7K. Una is forwarding a request for funding under separate email. 

Jeanne 
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