
From: 
To: Bella Klein • 

Subject: Fwd: Reimbursements for Lesley 
Date: Fri, 28 Feb 2014 14:59:06 +0000 

Attachments: SKMBT_C25314022612420.pdf 

HI Bella...need to add $4.19to my reimbursements...I bought some french vanilla coffee mate this moming...total 
is now $180.72 (whenever you can today...no rush) 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Reimbursements for Lesley 
Date: February 26, 2014 12:08:54 PM  EST 
To: Bella Klein 41 

Hi Bella...please reimburse me $176.53...it is all food accept for one book for JE from Amazon for $44.48. 
thanks! Lesley 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Message from KMBT_C253 
Date: Februa 26, 2014 11:43:03 AM EST 
To: 
Reply-To: 

EFTA00373822


