
From: Richard Kahn < 
To: Lesley Groff < 
Cc: Joe Thakuria

Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 
Date: Fri, 28 Feb 2014 21:31:19 +0000 

> 

Jeffrey has approved the 11,400 
Please send me an invoice so work can begin immediately 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 

On Feb 21, 2014, at 6:34 PM, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 

Hello Joe. I have Jeffrey's accountant on this email as well, Rich Kahn . Jeffrey has told Rich he would like to 
do a $5000 genetic work up done for the time being. Could you coordinate with Rich regarding payment/next 
steps? 

Thank you, 
Lesley 
Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein 

Sent from my iPhone 

EFTA00373861


