From: Sue Caffrey <]} | NI
To: Lesley Groff <[ R -
Ce: Bob Caffrey <|i N -

Subject: RE: Question ...
Date: Tue, 04 Feb 2014 19:57:59 +0000
Attachments: CL&P check.pdf
Inline-Images: image001 png; image002 jpe; image003 jpe; image004 jpe:; image00s.png

Hi Lesley,

Bob paid it on November 5. See attached check.
It's on the spreadsheet under utilities.
If you paid it too, you should probably make sure CL&P applied it to your account.

Did you want Bob to reimburse you?

Sue Anne Caffrey
Sr. Account Manager

Lease Administration
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From: Lesley Groff [mailto: | GGG

Sent: Tuesday, February 04, 2014 2:28 PM
To: Bob Caffrey; Sue Caffrey
Subject: Question ...

This 1s a bill that I had to pay a few months ago...It was an outstanding bill that had never been paid...do you
know if we have been reimbursed for this? Can you tell by your spreadsheet?

Begin forwarded message:

From: [

Subject: Message from KMBT_C253
Date: February 4, 2014 1:56:42 PM EST

To: I
Reply-To: I

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be privileged and is
intended for the exclusive use of the above named addressee(s). If you are not the intended
recipient{s), you are expressly prohibited from copying, distributing, disseminating, or in
any other way using any information contained within this communication. If you have received
this communicaticon in error please contact the sender by telephone or by response via mail.

We have taken precautions to minimize the risk of transmitting software viruses, but we
advise you to carry out your own wvirus checks on any attachment to thiz message. We cannot
accept liability for any loss or damage caused by scftware viruses.
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