
From: Lany Visoski <Ma> 

To: Stalin Fernandez  

Cc: Charter Coordinators <charter@meridian.aero>, 
>, Accounting <Accounting@merithan.aero> 

Subject: Re: Charter quote 

Date: Mon, 03 Feb 2014 19:09:08 +0000 

>, Rich Kahn 

Are we still ago for 4 o'clock? I wanted to confirm before I had my boss leave the city thank you Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Feb 3, 2014, at 1:38 PM, Stalin Fernandez < > wrote: 

I did, 
That's what happens when you deal with a company like ours, we do that kind of stuff sometimes© 

Please advise on wire ASAP... 

Stalin Fernandez 
Charter Sales 

485 Industrial Avenue - Teterboro. NJ 07608 
P: 800-882-2333x222 www.meridian.aero 
ARG-US Platinum/ISBAO Compliant/Wyvern Recommended 

From: Larry Vlsosld 
Sent: Monday, February 03, 2014 1:37 PM 
To: Stalin Fernandez 
Cc: Charter Coordinators; 
Subject: Re: Charter quote 

mallto: 

MI; Rich Kahn; Accounting 

Did you say there was no additional cost? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Feb 3, 2014, at 1:33 PM, Stalin Fernandez < > wrote: 

Larry, 
Great news! 
Your flight just got upgraded to a G-IV aircraft (Challenger couldn't go down to FL today & back in time for tomorrow's 
trip; additional cost to you. 
See pictures & diagrams of this aircraft here: http://www.meridianaircharter.com/index.php?page=N403T8 
Will keep you posted with our departure. 
Any word on the wire? 
Please reply to all... 

Stalin Fernandez 
Charter Sales 
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485 Industrial Avenue - Teterboro. NJ 07608 
P: 800-882-2333x222 www.meridian.aero 
ARG-US PlattnumilSBAO CompliantiWyvern Recommended 

From: Larry Vlsosld 
Sent: Monday, February 03, 2014 1:19 PM 
To: Stalin Fernandez 
Cc: Charter Coordinators; 
Subject: Re: Charter quote 

mailto: 

IM; Rich Kahn 

Can you please forward tail number and trip sheet to the addresses on this email thank you Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Feb 3, 2014, at 1:05 PM, Stalin Fernandez < wrote: 

Larry, 
Any catering today? Ground transportation set up? 

Stalin Fernandez 
Charter Sales 

485 Industrial Avenue - Teterboro, NJ 07608 
P: 800-882-2333x222 www.meridian.aero 
ARG-US Platinum/ISBAO CompliantiWyvern Recommended 

From: Larry Vlsosld ri(Sa 
Sent: Monday, February 03, 2014 12:54 PM 
To: Stalin Fernandez 
Cc: Charter Coordinators 
Subject: Re: Charter quote 

Are we good for 4pm today? Wheels up 

Keep me posted 
Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Feb 3, 2014, at 11:24 AM, Stalin Fernandez < 

Hey Larry, 
Galaxy is fine in PM, Meridian at TEB. 
Standby for tripsheet... 

Stalin Fernandez 
Charter Sales 

485 Industrial Avenue - Teterboro. NJ 07608 
P: 800-882-2333x222 www.meridian.aero 
ARG-US Platinum/ISBAO CompliantiWyvern Recommended 

From: Lvjet mailbo: 
Sent: Monday, February 03, 2014 11:20 AM 
To: Stalin Fernandez 

wrote: 
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Cc: Charter Coordinators 
Subject: Re: Charter quote 

thank you Stalin, 
WHEELS UP 1600 local (4:00pm) TEB - PB1 
What FBO in Palm Beach, I'm based at Galaxy Aviation in P61 if that works for you? 

#1 Jeff.eripstein Lead Pax, 
#2 
I will sign contract now and email back to you asap 

thanks 
Larry Visoski 
Chief Pilot, JEGE, LLC N212JE 
 Original Message-----
From: Stalin Fernandez 
To: 'Larry Visoski < 
Cc: Charter Coordinators <charter@meridian.aero>
Sent: Mon, Feb 3, 2014 10:54 am 
Subject: RE: Charter quote 

Here you go Larry, 
Revised CL601 quote attached, please fill out/sign s return . 
A 1400 departure works best for us in terms of tomorrow's projected aircraft 
activity; please advise if this is doable??? 

Stalin Fernandez 
Charter Sales 

485 Industrial Avenue - Teterboro, NJ 07608 
P: 800-882-2333x222 www.meridian.aero 
ARG-US Platinum/ISBAO Compliant/Wyvern Recommended 

From: 
 Original 

Stalin 
Message 

Fernandez 
Sent: Monday, February 03, 2014 9:06 AM 
To: 'Larry Visoski' 
Cc: Charter Coordinators 
Subject: RE: Charter quote 

Thank you Larry, 
Let me check on that for you, stand by... 

Stalin Fernandez 
Charter Sales 

485 Industrial Avenue - Teterboro, NJ 07608 
P: 800-882-2333x222 www.meridian.aero 
ARG-US Platinum/ISBAO Compliant/Wyvern Recommended 

 Original Message 
From: Larry Visoski fnuilloillIIIIIIIIIII) 
Sent: Monday, February 03, 2014 9:01 AM 
To: Stalin Fernandez 
Cc: Charter Coordinators 
Subject: Re: Charter quote 

Hello 
Mr Epstein is interested in the Challenger, he asked me offer $25,000 for this 
trip? 
Please let me know if this works 
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Thank you, 
Larry Visoski 

Jege, LLC N212JE 
JEGE, Inc. N908JE 
3800 southern blvd suite 204 
Nest Palm Beach, Fl 33406 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Feb 3, 2014, at 8:09 AM, Stalin Fernandez < 
wrote: 

> 
> 

> 

> 

You go it Larry, 
Please follow these links for pics: 

http://www.meridianaircharter.com/index.php?page=N832CB 

http://www.meridianaircharter.com/index.php?page=N601AD 

> Stalin Fernandez 
> Charter Sales 

> 485 Industrial Avenue - Teterboro, NJ 07608 
> P: 800-882-2333x222 www.meridian.aero 
> ARG-US Platinum/ISBAO Compliant/Wyvern Recommended 

 Original Message 
> From: Larry 
> Sent: Monday, February 03, 2014 8:08 AM 
> To: Stalin Fernandez 
> Cc: Charter Coordinators 
> Subject: Re: Charter quote 

> Thx for quick response, can you send photo of interiors for each, if possible, 
I'm familiar with both aircraft sizes,. 
> Thx 
> Larry Visoski 

> Sent from my iPad 

>> On Feb 3, 2014, at 8:05 AM, Stalin Fernandez < 
wrote: 
> > 
>> Good morning Larry, 
>> Yes, we have availability for today, Citation VII 520.7k all in, CL601 $32.1k 
all in, please see quotes attached, let us know how we can help... 
> > 
> > 
>> Stalin Fernandez 
>> Charter Sales 
> > 
>> 485 Industrial Avenue - Teterboro, NJ 07608 
>> P: 800-882-2333x222 www.meridian.aero 
» ARG-US Platinum/ISBAO Compliant/Wyvern Recommended 
> > 
> > 
>> >  Original Message 
>> From: Larry Visoski 
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>> Sent: Monday, February 03, 2014 8:00 AM 
>> To: Stalin Fernandez 
>> Subject: Charter quote 
>> 
>> Hello Meridean, 
>> My GIV is down for maintenace do you have a mid size jet available today 
travel anytime after 4pm? 
>> KTEB - KPBI one way drop , passenger Mr Jeffrey Epstein. 
>> Please confirm you receive this message? 
>> 
>> Thank you 
>> Larry Visoski 

rhi.f pilot,  Jege, LLC 
>> ell 
>> 
>> 
>> Sent from my iPhone 
>> <JegeCL601.pdf> 
>> <JegeCVII.pdf> 

legeitin.pdf> 
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