
From: 
To: Bob Caffrey 

Subject: Fwd: Balance Due/Credit on Masterbath Fabrication 
Date: Thu, 16 Jan 2014 15:51:16 +0000 

Attachments: Inv_2952_from_Stepping_Ston.pdf 

bob, can you take Vicki a check?...or call her with the CC number? what ever is easiest... 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Vicki Heitz" 
Subject: Balance Due/Credit on Masterbath Fabrication 
Date: January 16, 2014 10:37:55 AM EST 
To: "Lesley Groff'  

c<Inv_2952_from_Stepping_Ston.pdf>> 
Hi Lesley 

Attached is the remianing balance due on your invoice after applying the 
credit. The vanity is going in today so if you could remit the payment 
by the end of the month, I would really appreciate it. Let me knoe if 
you need anything going forward. I really appreciate all your business. 

Thanks, 
Vicki 
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