From: Lesley Groff *_-f*
To: Richard Kahn *—-“-*
Subject: Re: Gotham
Date: Tue, 12 Nov 2013 18:01:41 +0000

sure. I'll ask Lvndsi in pegey's office

On MNov 12, 2013, at 12:59 PM, Richard Kahn f_ wrote:

Attached 1s what we sent in previous years
Can vou please confirm same for this vear contribution of 10,000 by Enhanced Education
Thank you

You can make the check out to Independent Filmmaker Project (IFP).

You can send the check to:
IFP

c/o Mitchell Micich

B6E lay S5treet

Suite 425

Brooklyn, NY 11201.

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
Mew York, New York 10022

EFTA00379860



