
From: Jenna Hackerman  

To: Marisa Frank <I >, Richard Kahn <I 

Cc: >, Jenna Friedman <1 

Subject: RE: Terms and Conditions screening at Core Club 

Date: Mon, 04 Nov 2013 15:42:46 +0000 

Attachments: 11_7_13_Peggy_Siegal.pdf 

Hi Richard, 

Please see the invoice from Core Club attached here. 

Thanks, 

Jenna 

From: Marisa Frank 
Sent: Monday, November 04, 2013 10:37 AM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: ; Jenna Hackerman; Jenna Friedman 
Subject: RE: Terms and Conditions screening at Core Club 

I mean how the money is reimbursed to Jeffrey. Got it check or wire. 

Thank you. 

From: Richard Kahn [mailto: 
Sent: Monday, November 04, 2013 10:35 AM 
To: Marisa Frank 
Cc: -;Jenna Hackerman; Jenna Friedman 
Subject: Re: Terms and Conditions screening at Core Club 

do you mean reimbursement from peggy siegal to Jeffrey? 

if so either check or wire is ok. 

Richard Kahn 
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HBRK Associates Inc. 

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 

On Nov 4, 2013, at 10:19 AM, Marisa Frank - > wrote: 

Hi Richard, 

looping in Jenna Hackerman who will send over the contract and final invoice. 

What form does the reimbursement need to be in? (wire, check etc.) 

Thank you. 

Marisa Frank 

From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Saturday, November 02 2013 11:28 AM 
To: Marisa Frank; 
Subject: Fwd: Terms and Conditions screening at Core Club 

Please send me bill Monday so we can review payments arrangements. Thank you. 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Date: November 2, 2013 at 11:18:30 AM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Subject: Re: Terms and Conditions screening at Core Club 

ok 
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On Sat, Nov 2, 2013 at 11:13 AM, Richard Kahn

Please advise. 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: November 1, 2013 at 9:32:23 PM EDT 
To: Rich Kahn
Subject: Fwd: Terms and Conditions screening at Core Club 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Marisa Frank <1 
Date: November 1, 2013, 6:00:56 PM EDT 
To: " t, 

Subject: Terms and Conditions screening at Core Club 

> wrote: 

We are putting together an event on November 7th for the film TERMS AND CONDITIONS MAY APPLY at the Core 
Club (screening at 7:30PM with reception to follow). When initially reaching out to the club they quoted us a rate 
with a special founding members discount fee applied, which was a 75% reduction. We had assumed that it was 
Peggy who was the founding member — however that is not the case. For some reason the club has Jeffrey linked to 
our account as the true founding member. 

Now the core club will only honor that pricing if the bill goes to Jeffrey and the payment comes from him. We would 
truly appreciate if Jeffrey would help us out in this situation as we have already sent out the invites to the event and 
finalized the budget with the studio. We can either pay Jeffrey before-hand or immediately reimburse him after 
payment is made, whichever he would like. 

Thank you for helping us out with this matter and we hope Jeffrey can come to the event. 

Best, 

Marisa 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to  and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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