
From: Lesley Groff cza. 
To: bellaklein 

Subject: Re: Cancelled Air France 2 for 1 flight for JE and 'Sept 26-Oct 5 
Date: Thu, 26 Sep 2013 20:48:51 +0000 

i am losing my mind...i have been on the phone with amex non stop today! I am on with them 
now! It is completely insane. I will have a glass of wine tonight@ 

On Sep 26, 2013, at 4:44 PM, bellaklein wrote: 

> I have no idea how you can handle it! :) 
> On Sep 26, 2013, at 4:23 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

>> Hi Bella...I cancelled the flight JE and were to take departing tonight, Sept. 26th 
returning on Oct. 5th... 
>> 
>> I don't know how you keep up with all this! yuk_Amex said it will take 1 to 2 billing 
cycles for you to see the credit. 
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