
From: Theresa Tomic 
To: Lesley Groff 

Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 
Date: Thu, 29 Aug 2013 20:24:51 +0000 

Fabulous - and it was very nice working with you too. 
Kindest regards, 
Theresa 

On Thu, Aug 29, 2013 at 4:18 PM, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 
Great working with you too!! I will definitely send you the confirm of ticket...and as soon as I coordinate the 
car service, will get that to you as well. Not sure if Jeffrey's private driver will be making the trip or if I will 
hire our service... 

Thanks and have a great evening, Lesley 

On Aug 29, 2013, at 4:15 PM, Theresa Tomic wrote: 

Hi Leslie, 
Sounds great Lesley. That's what I thought and also, its a late afternoon flight to NYC and a late pm flight 
back to Boston, just what they need to have a dinner meeting, etc. 
Thanks and when you confirm, would you email me and Neil as well! If you need any help, please let me 
know. Its been very nice working with you again. 
Kindest regards, 
Theresa 

On Thu, Aug 29, 2013 at 4:04 PM, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 
it's refundable...I think I buy it, and if he doesn't want it, we can still figure something els out or get our 
money back! :) 

On Aug 29, 2013, at 4:01 PM, Theresa Tomic wrote: 

Hi Leslie, 
I haven't heard back from him...they're still in Japan with the Fab9 Conference. By now, I know that both 
your and my emails have reached him in Japan. However, I understand that we don't want to wait too 
long. What is your phone number and I can call you. 
Thanks 
Theresa 

On Thu, Aug 29, 2013 at 3:23 PM, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 
Hi Theresa...any word from Neil? Did he approve the trip? 

:) Lesley 

On Aug 29, 2013, at 10:14 AM, Theresa Tomic wrote: 
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Hi Lesley, 
Thank you for all your help. 
Kindest, 
Theresa 

On Thu, Aug 29, 2013 at 10:09 AM, Lesley Groff > wrote: 
oh no! I'm glad you feel better today! I actually just re-sent the email to Neil and cc'd you...in case 
you were out! (and you were!) 

Once you speak to Neil, get back to me and I will take care of everything! 

Thanks, Lesley 

On Aug 29, 2013, at 10:06 AM, Theresa Tomic wrote: 

Good morning Leslie, 
My apologies for the late response I was unexpectedly sick yesterday. These flights look good 
and I believe that this would work for Neil. I would like to check with Neil to confirm. I'll get 
back to you asap with his response. 
Kindest regards, 
Theresa 

On Wed, Aug 28, 2013 at 9:56 AM, Lesley Groff > wrote: 
Hello Theresa...Hope all is well... 

After investigating some, we found a flight that departs at 10:55pm on Jet Blue on Sept. 4th, 
arrives Boston at 11:58pm! We would be happy to sit Neil in 1st class on the US Air flight 
down to NY and then purchase him extra leg room on the Jet Blue flight back (Jet Blue does not 
have first class, only "extra leg room") 

Instead of the Air Taxi evening of Sept 4th, would this 10:55pm flight on Jet Blue be acceptable 
to Neil? Jeffrey says it is ok with him if OK with Neil. 

Please let me know and I will book! Also, we will take care of a car service for Neil here in NY 
both ways of course! 

Thanks, 
Lesley 
Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein 

US AirbetBlue - $318.58 
US2155 04SEP BOSLGA 
B6 718 04SEP JFKBOS 

400P 518P 
1055P 1158P 

Theresa Tomic 
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