
From: Robert McCoy czi 

To: Lesley Groff <I 

Subject: RE: Flight for Neil Gershenfeld paid for by Jeffrey Epstein 

Date: Thu, 29 Aug 2013 20:27:03 +0000 

Great - thanks 

From: Lesley Groff [mailto 
Sent: Thursday, August 29, 2013 4:23 PM 
To: Robert McCoy 
Subject: Re: Flight for Neil Gershenfeld paid for by Jeffrey Epstein 

All good ! Please go ahead and purchase the tickets..thanks 

On Aug 29, 2013, at 4:20 PM, Robert McCoy wrote: 

Hi --

Thanks for the update — here is the updated fare for you: 

US Air -  $ 458.90 

US2155 04SEP BOSLGA 400P 518P 

JetBlue —  $ 109.90 + extra legroom 

86 718 04SEP JFKBOS 1055P 1158P 

Let me know if that is okay — both fares are refundable. 

Thanks, 

Robert 
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ROBERT MCCOY I THE TRAVEL COLLABORATIVE I BELL TRAVEL GROUP 

direct I fax 

toll-free direct 

www.travelcollaborative.corn I skype 

o member of The hell Travel Group 

b,-t] Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail 

From: Lesley Groff fmailto: 
Sent: Thursday, August 29, 2013 4:16 PM 
To: Robert McCoy 
Subject: Flight for Neil Gershenfeld paid for by Jeffrey Epstein 

HI Robert...let's go ahead and book this flight for Neil in first class on the US Air flight and with Extra Leg 
Room on the JEt Blue flight. Jeffrey approved it on my end...Neil is in Japan and not answered as of yet...but 
Theresa, his assistant, seems to think it will all be fine. 

Please charge the ticket to Jeffrey Epstein's Amex: 

Please send me a copy of the receipt. IF you need anything else, just let me know! 

Thanks, Lesley 
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On Aug 27, 2013, at 4:13 PM, Robert McCoy wrote: 

Hi --

Thanks for the call — here are the flight details with the JFK late return: 

US Air/JetBlue — $318.58 

LIS2155 04SEP BOSLGA 400P 518P 

86 718 04SEP JFKBOS 1055P 1158P 

We could also put Neil in first on the US Air flight down -coach on the return with extra legroom —fare is $640.80, 
refundable. 

Thanks, 

Robert 

ROBERT MCCOY I THE TRAVEL COLLABORATIVE I TZELL TRAVEL GROUP 

Irect I fax 

II-free direct I 

I www.travelcollaborative.com I *a 

o member of The Tien Trove! Group 

lift] Please consider the environment before printing this email 
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From: Lesley Groff rmailto: 
Sent Tuesday, August 27, 2013 11:17 AM 
To: Robert McCoy 
Subject: Re: 
Importance: High 

ok, just for paperworks sake, lets hang in...I think by end of today, we should know what we are doing...and if 
not, then I will call you anyway and we will book the trip here to NY at least. 

thanks 

On Aug 27, 2013, at 11:15 AM, Robert McCoy wrote: 

Hi - 

Thanks for the update — either is fine. It is a fully refundable/changeable fare if you want to ticket now. We have the 
ability to move him around on different flights if needed. 

Thanks, 

Robert 

ROBERT MCCOY I THE TRAVEL COLLABORATIVE I TZELL TRAVEL GROUP 

Wed a 
fax 

Il-free direct 

www.travelcollaborative.com I slcype 

o member of The Tien Trove! Group 
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bA Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail 

From: Lesley Groff [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, August 27, 2013 11:05 AM 
To: Robert McCoy 
Subject: Re: 

I 

HI Robert...we are still figuring out Neil's trip home...should I call and book his to NY with you now, or does it 
still appear to be pretty wide open? 

Lesley 

On Aug 23, 2013, at 4:46 PM, Robert McCoy wrote: 

Let me know what the Air Taxi information is well. I can check with our NYC office to see if we can issue from here. 

Thanks, 

Robert 

ROBERT MCCOY I THE TRAVEL COLLABORATIVE I TZELL TRAVEL GROUP 

Sect 

ll-free direct I 

fax 

EFTA00384724



I www.travelcollaborative.com I skype 

a member of The Tien Trovel Group 

bi,-.; Please consider the environment before printing this email 

From: Lesley Groff [mailto: 
Sent: Friday, August 23, 2013 11:20 AM 
To: Theresa Tomic 
Cc: Robert McCoy 
Subject: Re: 

oh wow...I had never heard of it until Neil mentioned it! I thought it was something you did all the time...? He 
sent us something back in another email ....let me find and I'll send to you...I think you need an account...perhaps 
Neil has one and didn't tell you?! ;) 

On Aug 23, 2013, at 11:15 AM, Theresa Tomic wrote: 

Hi Leslie, 

Ok for the flight out, but I'm not familiar with the Air Taxi and how that works? Is it similar to a commercial 
airline? Any information you provide is most helpful. 

Thanks, 
Theresa 

On Fri, Aug 23, 2013 at 11:00 AM, Lesley Groff < wrote: 

Super! Jeffrey did prefer Neil to arrive on the 5:18 flight, so that is great. I believe Jeffrey would like Neil to 
take the Air Taxi back to Boston...can you advise how that works? Do we name the time we want wheels up? 
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...and I am happy to call Robert with our credit card for the outgoing flight once we figure out the return 
flight...then we can do all together? 

thanks, Lesley 

On Aug 23, 2013, at 10:50 AM, Theresa Tomic wrote: 

Hi Robert, 
These flights work great for Neil. Leslie by way of introduction Robert McCoy is our travel agent who works 
very closely with Neil. The flights below would work just fine for Neil's quick trip to NYC. Robert has all Neil's 
information so basically all that's needed is a credit card to book the airfare. When that's done, Robert sends us 
eTickets. If this works for you let me and Robert know. All Robert's and my contact information is below for 
your reference. Please let me know if you need any additional information, etc. 

I hope to see you again soon! 
Kindest regards, 
Theresa Tomic 

 Forwarded message   
From: Robert McCoy <1 
Date: Thu, Aug 22, 2013 at 5:22 PM 
Subject: RE: Fwd: 
To: Theresa Tomic

Sure: 

US Air - $273.36 

US2155 04SEP BOSLGA 400P 518P 

EFTA00384726



US2164 04SEP LGABOS 900P 1011P 

Thanks, 

Robert 

ROBERT MCCOY I THE TRAVEL COLLABORATIVE I TZELL TRAVEL GROUP 

irect I fax 

ll-free direct I 

I www.travelcollaborative.com I skyia 

o member of The Tien Trove! Group 

bA Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail 

From: Theresa Tomic [mailto 
Sent: Thursday, August 22, 2013 4:54 PM 

To: Robert McCoy 
Subject: Re: Fwd: 

Hi Robert, 

Is there any availability on the 4:00pm from Boston to LGA? 

Let me know. 
I'm heading out but will recheck email after 6:00pm and confirm. 
Thank you 
Theresa 

On Thu, Aug 22, 2013 at 4:12 PM, Robert McCoy <1  wrote: 
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Sure — that would only give him 1 hour, 32 minutes at the airport — he has to be at the gate 1-hour prior to departure? 

US Air -  273.36 

US2157 04SEP BOSLGA 500P 618P 

US2164 04SEP LGABOS 900P 1011P 

Thanks, 

Robert 

ROBERT MCCOY I THE TRAVEL COLLABORATIVE I TZEU. TRAVEL GROUP 

direct I fax 

toll-free direct 

I www.travelcollaborative.com I skype 

a member of The Tien Trove! Group 

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail 

From: Theresa Tomic [mailto 
Sent: Thursday, August 22, 2013 4:01 PM 
To: Robert McCoy 
Subject: Re: Fwd: 

Hi Robert, 

How about a 5:00pm Dep from Bos to LGA on 4 September. Can Neil return on the 9:00pm flight from LGA to 
BOS on the same day? 
Thanks 
Theresa 
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On Thu, Aug 22, 2013 at 3:28 PM, Robert McCoy < > wrote: 

Hi —

Thanks for the note — I think that he may have the departure times mixed up with the arrival times. Here are the shuttles 
times: 

September 4 — Boston to LaGuardia 

US 2153 BOSLGA 300P 414P 

US 2155 BOSLGA 400P 518P 

US 2157 BOSLGA 500P 618P 

US 2159 BOSLGA 600P 722P 

September 5 — LaGuardia to Boston 

US 2162 LGABOS 800P 914P 

()S 2164 LGABOS 900P 1011P 

Let me know the times that work best. 

Thanks, 

Robert 

ROBERT MCCOY I THE TRAVEL COLLABORATIVE I TZELL TRAVEL GROUP 

direct ax 

toll-free direct 

I www.travelcollaborative.com I skype 

a member of The Tzell Travel Group 
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Please consider the environment before printing this email 

From: Theresa Tomic [mallto 
Sent: Thursday, August 22, 2013 10:31 AM 
To: Robert McCoy 
Subject: Fwd: 

Hi Robert, 

Can you check flights for Neil to go to Laguardia (LGA) on Sept 4th in the late afternoon? 

He would like to take the 4 September 2013 5:18P or 6:18p flight and return the same evening 4 September 2013 
on the last flight 9:00pm. 

Can you let me know so I can update Neil as he is in Japan now at the FabLab conference. 
Kindest regards, 
Theresa 

 Forwarded message 
From: Neil Gershenfeld  a 
Date: Wed, Aug 21, 2013 at 5:45 PM 
Subject: Re: 
To: Lesley Groff <1 >, Theresa Tomic

Lesley, Theresa, 

I'm going to join Jeff for dinner on Sept 4. 

I need to be in Boston midday on the 4th, and back that night. 

I could take a mid-late afternoon Shuttle down (US Air), then car from LGA, and either last Shuttle back 
(9:00P), or air taxi to stay later (Linear Air). 

Can you work together to arrange? 

Neil 
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On Thu, Aug 22, 2013 at 6:33 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

lesley will cooridante 

On Wed, Aug 21, 2013 at 3:32 PM, Neil Gershenfeld < wrote: 

OK, I'll do an evening-trip on the 4th for dinner 

Do you have someone my assistant can work with to arrange? 

On Thu, Aug 22, 2013 at 6:15 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

I can pick up expenses , you choose 

On Wednesday, August 21, 2013, Neil Gershenfeld wrote: 

Jeff, 

I'm scheduled in Boston 4th midday and 5th. I could take a Shuttle down getting into LGA e.g. 5:18P or 6:18P, 
then last Shuttle back leaving LGA 9:00P (or later on an air taxi). If this is set, I could go ahead and book that. 

Theresa Tomic 
Executive Assistant to the Director 
Center for Bits and Atoms 
Massachusetts Institute of Technology 
20 Ames Street, Bldg E15-401 
Cambrid e MA 02139 

Phone 
Fax 

Theresa Tomic 
Executive Assistant to the Director 
Center for Bits and Atoms 
Massachusetts Institute of Technology 
20 Ames Street, Bldg E15-401 
Cambridge, MA 02139 
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Phone 
Fax 

Theresa Tomic 
Executive Assistant to the Director 
Center for Bits and Atoms 
Massachusetts Institute of Technology 
20 Ames Street, Bldg E15-401 
Cambrid e MA 02139 

Phone 
Fax 

Theresa Tomic 
Executive Assistant to the Director 
Center for Bits and Atoms 
Massachusetts Institute of Technology 
20 Ames Street, Bldg E15-401 

02139 
Phone 
Fax 

Theresa Tomic 
Executive Assistant to the Director 
Center for Bits and Atoms 
Massachusetts Institute of Technology 
20 Ames Street, Bldg E15-401 

A 02139 
Phone 
Fax 
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