
From: Ike Groff <I 
To: 'Sue Caffrey' <I  k Lesley Groff <I 

Cc: Robert czi 
Subject: RE: Update of costs 

Date: Wed, 31 Jul 2013 21:04:06 +0000 
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Ok I think maybe it is the cut to the street for the sewer hook up. 

From: Sue Caffrey [mallto: 
Sent: Wednesday, July 31, 2013 4:39 PM 
To: Ike Groff; Lesley Groff 
Cc: Robert 
Subject: RE: Update of costs 

The difference is the $20,000 that Bob estimated we'd need to pay Nelson for digging the foundation. I input it 
in Quickbooks so it shows as a cost although it was never paid. I'll talk to Bob to see if that will need to be paid 
or if we can just delete it from Quickbooks. 

So the actual amount paid for excavation is the lower number. 

Sue Anne Caffrey 

Sr. Account Manager 

Lease Administration 
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Driven! C&W's 2011/2012 Annual Review: now available online 

From: Ike Groff [mailto: 
Sent: Wednesday, July 31, 2013 3:57 PM 
To: Sue Caffrey; Lesley Groff 
Cc: Robert 
Subject: RE: Update of costs 

Sue, 

Excavation on the two sheet is S20k different. Do you have the correct number? 

From: Sue Caffrey imailto: 
Sent: Wednesday, July 31, 2013 2:44 PM 
To: Lesley Groff; Ike Groff 
Cc: Robert 
Subject: Update of costs 

Hi Ike and Lesley, 

I've attached the report from Quickbooks - Estimate to Actuals - and the updated excel spreadsheet. 

This reflects what has cleared the bank to date. 

Any questions, just let me know. 

Thanks 

Sue Anne Caffrey 

Sr. Account Manager 

Lease Administration 
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This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, 
you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this e-mail and any attachment(s) is strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error 
please immediately notify the sender at 203-302-7300 or by replying to this e-mail and delete the e-mail and any attachment(s) from your system. Nothing herein shall 
be construed as a financial promotion to any person or persons, or a solicitation or recommendation to buy or sell any security or other investment or to engage in any 
trading strategy. Information presented is from sources believed to be reliable, but is not guaranteed to be accurate or complete. This information should not be taken 
as an offer nor as a solicitation of an offer to buy or sell securities or other financial instruments. Email transmission cannot be guaranteed to be secure, timely or error 
free. Tourmaline Partners, LLC may review and store both incoming and outgoing messages. Use by other than the intended recipients is prohibited. 

The information contained in this communication is confidential. may be privileged and is intended for the exclusive use of the above named addressee(s). If you are not the 
.,tended recipient(s), you are expressly prohibited from copykig. distributing. disseminating, or ki any other way using any .,formation contained within this commun.:alio:O. If 
you have received this communication in error please contact the sender by telephone or by response via mail. 

We have taken precautions to minimize the risk of transmittrig software viruses. but we advise you to carry out your own virus checks on any attachment to thus message. We 
cannot accept liability for any loss or damage caused by software viruses. 

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended onty for the person or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, 
you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this e-mail and any attachment(s) is strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in 
error please immediately notify the sender at 203-302-7300 or by replying to this e-mail and delete the e-mail and any attachment(s) from your system. Nothing 
herein shall be construed as a financial promotion to any person or persons, or a solicitation or recommendation to buy or sell any security or other investment or to 
engage in any trading strategy. Information presented is from sources believed to be reliable, but is not guaranteed to be accurate or complete. This information 
should not be taken as an offer nor as a solicitation of an offer to buy or sell securities or other financial instruments. Email transmission cannot be guaranteed to be 
secure, timely or error free. Tourmaline Partners, LLC may review and store both incoming and outgoing messages. Use by other than the intended recipients is 
prohibited. 
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