
From: ==la 
To: Robert la 

Subject: Re: Front doors? 
Date: Fri, 28 Jun 2013 13:34:20 +0000 

Great. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 28, 2013, at 9:29 AM, "Robert" < > wrote: 

> They are scheduled to be july15 

• Original Message 
> From: Lesley Groff [mailto: 
> Sent: Friday, June 28, 2013 9:22 AM 
> To: Robert 
> Subject: Front doors? 

> • Ha! Holy cow, I know you paid Nukitchens! You are answering an old 
> question. Below I am asking you if you know when the front doors are to be 
> delivered? Then I asked about the rails. ..don't worry. I will call you 
> later. I am meeting Vicki at stepping stones at 10. 

> Sent from my iPhone 

> On Jun 28, 2013, at 9:08 AM, "Robert" .‘Z > wrote: 

>> Yes I paid nu kitchens yesterday 
>> 

 Original Message 
>> From: Lesley Groff [manta: 
>> Sent: Friday, June 28, 2013 9:03 AM 
>> To: Robert 
>> Cc: Ike Groff 
>> Subject: Re: Was Check to Nukitchens sent? here is their address 
>> 
» ?? You ordered the front doors? Do you mean you met with the guy to 
» do the rails yesterday? 
>> 
>> Sent from my iPhone 
>> 
>> On Jun 28, 2013, at 8:54 AM, "Robert" wrote: 
>> 
>>> I met with a guy on that yesterday. The first guy hasn't gotten me a 
>> quote. 
>>> I think we should consider stone around the garage door area. 
>>> 
>>>  Original Message 
>>> From: Lesley Groff [mailto: 
>>> Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2013 2:24 PM 
>>> To: Robert 
>>> Cc: Ike Groff 
>>> Subject: Re: Was Check to Nukitchens sent? here is their address 
>>> 
>>> oh great! does the kitchen layout look good on the floor? 
>» I think I will transfer some funds because I see you have sent 
>>> another email with other upcoming invoice info. 
>» When does the front door and door by juliet balcony arrive? 
>>> 
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>>> On Jun 27, 2013, at 2:13 PM, Robert wrote: 
>>> 
>>>> I met with them this morning and they laid out the kitchen on the 
>>>> floor so we can add duct work in the kick plates and locate the sink 
»» in 
>» the island. 
>>>> I gave them 12,000 exact. I am going to have to pay the mason for 
>>>> back fill and pouring the patios. We have enough money I think. 
>>>> 
>>>>  Original Message 
>>>> From: Lesley Groff [mailto: 
>>>> Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2013 1:30 PM 
>>>> To: Bob and Sue Caffrey; Bob Caffrey 
>>>> Cc: Ike Groff 
>>>> Subject: Was Check to Nukitchens sent? here is their address 
>>>> 
>>>> I realized I did not send you Nukitchens address...was the check 
>>>> sent as of yet for: 
>>>> 
>>>> $12,019.60 
>>>> 
>>>> NUKITCHENS SHOWROOM 
>>>> 132 Water Street 
>>>> South Norwalk, CT 
>>> 
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