
From: "Peggy Siegal" 
To: "Felicia Monte" <a> 

Cc: "Lesley Groff' •MINin 
Subject: Re: Gary Siegal 

Date: Thu, 23 May 2013 14:44:21 +0000 

Phil. Do we suggest, asking whether or not they would prefer a lawsuit to be filed. 

Gary will have to pay my fees and will lose. 

Please advise today. Jeffrey and I are awaiting your input. 
Thank you. Peggy 

Peggy Siegal Company 

 Original Message 
From: "Peggy Siegal" ‹ > 
Date: Thu, 23 May 2013 00:46:51 
To: Felicia Monte 
Reply-To: 
Cc: Lesley Groff 
Subject: Gary Siegal 

Phil- What is happening? Please update me asap. Thank you. 
Back from Cannes Film Festival on June 3. Would like to know if you have spoken to Gary's 
lawyers. What is the status. 
Thank you in advance for responding. Peggy 

Peggy Siegal Company 
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