From: "Jeanne Brennan" < || N -
To: "Lesley Groff™ *L_-“-*
Subject: RE:
Date: Tue, 16 Apr 2013 14:17:41 +0000

Thank you.

From: Lesley Groff [mailto: || G

Sent: Tuesday, April 16, 2013 10:14 AM
To: Jeanne Brennan
Subject: Re:

is this CT Corp?
If s0, I have:

Claudia Lardizabal is our contact. She 15 at extension -

Customer #1444471

I think that should work!

On Apr 16, 2013, at 10:10 AM, Jeanne Brennan wrote:

| will call CTC in deleware. Do you have a contact person and number for them.

From: Lesley Groff [mailto:

Sent: Tuesday, April 16, 2013 10:03 AM
To: Jeanne Brennan
Subject: Re:
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Ok, unfortunately, I do not have this in the office...l am happy to call GRM and get the box here and take a
look...we could either have it rushed for today or we could get tomorrow...but this all costs money and 1f you can
make a free phone call, perhaps that 1s better?

You just let me know...

On Apr 16, 2013, at 9:45 AM, Jeanne Brennan wrote:

This is what | am looking for. | will call the CTC if you don't have.

From: Lesley Groff [mailto: |

Sent: Tuesday, April 16, 2013 9:44 AM
To: Jeanne Brennan
Subject: Re:

Hi Jeanne...I see we have the closing binder for LSJ, LLC in storage...do you think it would be in there (because
[ don't see and LSJ, LLC redweld file here in the office...only an LSJ Operating File and there is no Certificate of
Formation in there)

Let me know if you want me to have this box pulled from storage to check for a signed doc..

thanks, Les

On Apr 16, 2013, at 9:20 AM, Jeanne Brennan wrote:

Please look in the organizational file for LSJ, LLC to see if we have a Signed Certificate of Formation. | have an unsigned
one in my file. Thxs Jeanne

EFTA00392299



<20130416084613959.pdf>

EFTA00392300



