From: "Robert" <
To: "Lesley Grofr” < -

Subject: RE: questions...
Date: Tue, 26 Feb 2013 23:51:33 +0000

————— Original Message-----

From: Lesley Groff [mailto: _1

Sent: Tuesday, February 26, 2013 Z: EM

m

To: Bob Caffrey
Subject: gquestions.

Hi Bob...i see you wrote a check for 52000 to Optimus Logistics on Feb 7.. at is this? I
zee it is a transport company? What did you have to transport...the c:anc?

Are you doing your homework tonight? Your Quicken spread sheet...I'm going te encourage sSue
to give you crap until you do! )

That is Nelsons company

The longer you wait the harder it is to fill it out....gotta get it going!
.and then keep up with it...way easier if vyou don't get behind!

The Berkeley Construction account has 537,702.%3...1 know you still have to pay Superior
Walls...that check will be for 530,000.00 right?

33,920.20

BTW, we did take a ride over to the property after Ty's doctor appt (Ty and Ike came with me)
and the men were still there working! It was like

5:10...wanted you to know.

Yea that is a pretty good crew

;) Les

EFTA00394639



