From: "Milten, Jessica" <[ AR -
: >, Eliza <[ -

Ce: Nikki Bernstein <[ AR -

Subject: RE: Night Before benefiting MPTF 2-23-13

Date: Mon, 18 Feb 2013 18:09:49 +0000

Hi Ladies,

| hope this email finds you well and you are enjoying your long weekend! My office is handling the paperwork for the single
ticket to our upcoming Night Before benefit this weekend, but if you could please send over the following information it

would help expedite process:

m Business/Company Name
= Contact/clo

= Billing Address

= Phone

Thank you so much!
Best,

Jessica

Jessica Milten

Manager, Special Events
MPTF Foundation

23388 Mulholland Drive
Suite 220

Woodland Hills, CA 91364

From: Peggy Siegal [mailto: [ I
Sent: Friday, February 15, 2013 1:49 PM

To: Barrie Robinson; Eliza;

Cc: Milten, Jessica; Nikki Bernstein

Subject: Re: Night Before benefiting MPTF 2-23-13

EFTA00395332



Too Lesley Groff on behalf of leffrey Epstein.

Lesley: Barrie will email us the payment form for Jeffrey Katzenberg's "Night Before' party at the BHH on Saturday, Feb.
23rd. It's a tax deductible donation which allows me to attend.

Thanks so much. | will be at the BHH Thursday. xoxo Peggy

From: Peggy Siegal
Sent: Thursday, February 14, 2013 08:41 PM
To: < = Eliza

Cc < >; < I -

Subject: Re: Night Before benefiting MPTF 2-23-13

Dear Barrie:
Thank you so much for bending the rules and selling me a ticket....for such a worthy cause.

I will work out the details tomorrow....xoxo peggy

From: barrie robinson [mailto:
Sent: Thursday, February 14, 2013 08:39 PM
To: Peggy Siegal

Cc: Allison Reddington; Milten, Jessica </ GGG - Vi ernstein < || TG -

Subject: Night Before benefiting MPTF 2-23-13

Dear Peggy,

Delighted to confirm your single ticket request for a donation of $15,000.00

Jessica and MIkki will facilitate your contribution and I'll be your contact for the event itself.
If memaory serves, you will be staying at The Hotel and wont need a parking pass?

See you soon and look forward to meeting you after all of these years.

Warmly,

Barrie

EFTA00395333



