From: Lesley Groff q~_f*
To: Harry Beller {_‘-*
Subject: Re: AYH
Date: Mon, 04 Feb 2013 20:15:54 +0000

vou will recieve the below box tomorrow from GRM between 9-12:00

GRM#004740712 (Pulled by Harry Feb. 5, 2013)

FTC Old Investment Partnership Agreements

FTC Consulting Agreement w/Highbridge Management

APPLICATION FOR ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT BENEFITS FOR FTC, EXTENSION (DRAFT)

SECOND CITY CAPITAL PARTNERS LIMITED PARTNERSHIP BINDER (CLOSING BINDER
FROM SECOND CITY CAPITAL PARTNERS L, LP)

-Ryder Properties Loan from Carey 16 Lending Corp. $73,200,000 June 22, 2007

Purchase of Island Global/AYH Ownership

On Feb 4, 2013, at 3:08 PM, Harry Beller wrote:

Begin forwarded message:

From: Darren Indyke <

Date: February 4, 2013 2:53:50 PM EST
To: Harry Beller </ -
Subject: Re: AYH

Ask Lesley if she has it here. If not ask Jeanne or check the Storage List to see if the file i1s in Storage.
Thanks.

DARREN K. INDYKE
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC

EFTA00396296
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The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - ® 2011 Darren K.

Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved.
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On Feb 4, 2013, at 2:45 PM, Harry Beller wrote:

Darren
do you have the partnership agreement for IGY-AYH St Thomas Holdings, LLC
thanks

Harry

EFTA00396297



