
From: Lesley Groff
To: "G. Steven Burrill" <Ma> 

Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 
Date: Wed, 02 Jan 2013 15:50:45 +0000 

Thank you Steve! I will pass along...and Happy New Year to you as well. 

On Jan 2, 2013, at 10:29 AM, G. Steven Burrill wrote: 

> Actually it closed n we are negotiating some minor tweaks to the Mgrnt agreement but the 
money is in the trust n the mgmt agreement should be completed this week...so I think I won n 
don't owe Jeffrey the $1 but if he needs it, tell him I'm happy to send it. 

> And happy new year to both of u 

> Steve 

9t9t**WWW**WWW**WWW*** 

> G. Steven Burrill 
> Chief Executive Officer 
> Burrill S, Company 

> On Jan 2, 2013, at 8:43 AM, "Lesley Groff" -z: > wrote: 

>> Hello Mr. Burrill. Below is from Mr. Epstein: 

>> • "Did your fund close or are you going to send me $1.00? I hope it closed" 

>> Please forward your response to me and i will relay to Jeffrey. 

» Thank you, 
» Lesley 
>> Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein 
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