
From: 
To: 

Subject: Re: Confirmation 
Date: Mon, 17 Dec 2012 23:16:07 +0000 

Terrific! Thank you! Is it refundable? JE said should be refundable, we can do dates jan 5th - jan 10th, I forwarded you 
his email 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 17, 2012, at 5:58 PM, > wrote: 

Ok good. I will double check to make positive the hotel is located on the French side. The woman I am speaking with is 
Russian also and I told her it must be the French side. She is aware of what you are going through. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 17, 2012, at 5:45 PM, wrote: 

I have Schengen! Will the final destination be French part of VI? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 17, 2012, at 4:05 PM, 

Do you have a Schengen Visa to enter St. Maarten? 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Natalia X Molotkova" 
Subject: Confirmation 
Date: December 17, 2012 4:01:24 PM EST 
To: 

> wrote: 

I called you and left the voice mail. The last day to provide payment for the land portion is tomorrow. I can issue tickets today 
due to they are fully refundable. The land (accommodation and transfer) has to be paid in full by tomorrow. If you are ready 
to do it today, will need the CID number (the security code on the card, 4 digits and I am using Mrs. card. 

Please advise, 

P.S.: please be sure that she has all necessary documents to enter St Maarten (Schengen visa). 

Natalia (Natasha) Molotkoval Executive Travel Counselor 
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From: 
Sent: Monday, December 17, 2012 3:48 PM 
To: Natalia X Molotkova 
Subject: Re: Hold it let me hold only till tonight, but will try to call AMID( vacations to extend it till tomorrow 

if it is fully refundable (minus the travel insurance of course) then book it!! 

On Dec 17, 2012, at 3:42 PM, Natalia X Molotkova wrote: 

Booking Number: Lead Passenger: 

Hold - it let me hold only till tonight, but will try to call AMEX vacations to extend it till tomorrow 
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