From: Tke Groff </
To: 'Lesley Groff' < . -

Subject: RE: Final payment to Drenckhahn Excavating $14,000
Date: Thu, 06 Dec 2012 14:41:43 +0000

————— Original Message-----

From: Lesley Groff [mailto:| GG

Sent: Thursday, December 06, 2012 BE:42 AM

To: Ike Groff

Subject: Final payment to Drenckhahn Excavating 514,000

Final payment for 514,000 written to Drenckhahn Excavating on Dec 5 2012

Sent from my iFhonen

This e-maill and any files transmitted with it are confidentlial and intended conly for the
person or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this e-mail and any
attachment (2) is strictly prohibited. If wou have received this e-mail in error please
immediately notify the sender at i or by replying to this s-mail and delete the e-
mail and any attachment (s) from your system. HNothing herein shall be construed as a financial
promoticon to any person or persons, orF a solicitation or recommendation to buy or sell any
security or other investment or to engage in any trading strategy. Information presented is
from sources believed to be reliabkle, but i1s not guaranteed to be accurate or complete. This
information should not be taken as an offer nor as a solicitation of an offer to buy or sell
securities or other financial instruments. Email transmission cannot be guaranteed to be
zsecure, timely or error free. Tourmaline Partners, LLC may review and store both incoming and
oultgoing messages. Usze by other than the intended recipients is prohibited.
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