From: Lesley Groff <[
To: Robert <[ N
Ce: Tke Gro -

Subject: Re: Certificate of Insurance from Bob Caffrey-BerkeleyProperties-for Groff file
Date: Tue, 27 Nov 2012 22:40:37 +0000

Ok, thanks bob. This is definitely something to investigate more and I like the idea of only insuring what it built.
Talk to you later

Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 27, 2012, at 5:06 PM, "Robert" i—} wrote:

Its outrageous | got a quote like that. | would only insure it for half. Why should you pay full price when | only have a
foundation up. | will talk to my insurance rep. | think there is a way around this by only insuring what is built.

From: lesley taylor [mailto: |

Sent: Tuesday, Novemnber 27, 2012 4:30 PM

To: Bob Caffrey

Cc: ike groff Groff

Subject: FW: Certificate of Insurance from Bob Caffrey-BerkeleyProperties-for Groff file

Hey Bob...wanted to show you this quote...in your experience, do these numbers seem correct? It is expensive! 1 know
you suggested some other carriers...

From:

To:

CcC:

Date: Fri, 23 Mov 2012 09:23:37 -0500

Subject: RE: Certificate of Insurance from Bob Caffrey-BerkeleyProperties-for Groff file

Thanks for the revised certificate. Here are approximate quotes based on the completed value of 51,900,000 with
deductible options:

52500 deductible would be approximately $9513; 55000 deductible would be approximately 57139; 510k deductible
would be approximately 55946.

The liability would remain on your current policy but the physical damage for the dwelling will be the above builders
risk.

I am going to be out of the office next week returning on 12/3. This can go in effect once you start the framing so if you
don't think this will start until after next week we can wait until | get back.
Regards

Banbana Welmints

Brown Thayer Shedd, Inc.

980 Boston Post Road

EFTA00400681



Irs: 8:30 am to 4:30 pm

I
From: lesley taylor [mailto: |G

Sent: Tuesday, November 20, 2012 4:27 PM

To: Barbara Wilmink

Cc: ike groff Groff

Subject: FW: Certificate of Insurance from Bob Caffrey-BerkeleyProperties-for Groff file

Original Message-----
From: h[_

Sent: Tuesday, November 20, 2012 2:33 PM
To: h

Subject: Certificate of Insurance

Customer/Account: -B-nerl':lualleaﬁ,-r Construction LLC
Please find attached a copy of certificate.

Thank you for the opportunity to service your insurance needs.
<WRC_DS=000010657842</VRC_DS=>

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message may contain information that is
confidential and/or legally privileged. Any use, disclosure, distribution,

or duplication by anyone other than an intended recipient is prohibited. If
you received this message in error, please notify the sender and permanently
delete the original message, any copies and attachments from your computer
system.
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