
From: "Robert" <I 

To: "Lesley Groff" < 

Subject: FW: Revised Proposal 

Date: Wed, 28 Nov 2012 01:52:56 +0000 

Attachments: DOC111612berkley.pdf 

Foundation Invoice 

From: Robert [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, November 27, 2012 6:46 PM 
To: Lesley Groff ( ) 
Subject: FW: Revised Proposal 

We need a 30% deposit for this. The remainder gets paid when the walls are on site. 

From: Tami Ackert [mailto 
Sent: Friday, November 16, 2012 10:49 AM 
To: Wa ne McAuliff 
Cc: 
Subject: Revised Proposal 

Robert, 

Attached is the current pricing for your project. Wayne and I discussed a few changes this morning that are 
reflected in the attached proposal. 

We, unfortunately, are not providing bolts for sill plate at this time. If I can be of assistance in finding a location 
in the New Canaan area for these please let me know, I'd be happy to help. 

Thanks, 
Tami 

On 11/15/2012 1:03 PM, Wayne McAuliff wrote: 

HI Art, 

I forgot to mention that Robert will be going with a double sill plate so please provide long bolts. 
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Thank you, 

Wayne McAuliff 

Northeast Precast 

1142 Stanton Lebanon Road 

Lebanon, NJ 08833 
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