From: [
To: Lesley Groff q~_-“->
Ce: Rich Kahn <[ |
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein
Date: Fri, 16 Nov 2012 14:06:52 +0000

Hi Lesley,
Yes 1 received thanks, 1 want to confirm something with jeffrey so will get back to you.

Also, it would be preferable for me to just receive a wire for the full amount rather than piecemeal 1t on a cc, s0
let me check on something and get back to you!

Thanks,

On Nov 16, 2012, at 7:54 AM, Lesley Groff wrote:

T\-’Iuming- Rich Kahn suggested vou put the charge for vour flight on your credit card and send an
invoice to Enhanced Education and it will reimburse you

I see that your trip needs to be paid for by today.

Let me know! You received this. Thanks, Lesley

Sent from my iPhone

EFTA00401405



